Travel Food Services

Vendor No. V0002577

] CLUMIERES
405, 4 Hill View Industrial Estate, off LBS Marg

Purchase Order

Order Number BLR/P0/23-24/000695

Shipped Location

BLR Irish House

Terminal 2,Kempegowda Int.
Airport, KIAL Rd, Devanahalli

Invoice Location
BLR Irish House

Terminal 2,Kempegowda Int.

Airport, KIAL Rd, Devanahalli

Page No: 1
08-08-2023 17:58:42

Corporate Address
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED

Block-A South Wing 1st Floor Shiv Sagar

Estate

Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli Mumbai

MUMBAI 400018

Amrut Nagar, Ghatkopar West, Mumbai Bengaluru, India 560300 560300 State 27
MUMBAI, India 400086 India India State Name Maharashtra
India IN Comp GST No.  27AADCB2762L1ZI
P.A.N. No. AMHPC8610P Contact Person
State Code Contact No. 022-43224301.} 022-43224304 Requisition
E-Mail gaur.av.bhagallya@travelfood gaurav.bhagaliya@travelfoodservices.c  No.
services.com om
PO Entry Date 03-08-2023
Vendor GST No. 27AMHPC8610P1ZQ ETA: Payment Terms Net 30 Days y
Vendor Inv. No. Order Address GSTIN  29AADCB2762L1ZE ProjectID GEN
Vendor Fax No. No.
Vendor Email jclumieres@gmail.com
HSN\SAC Total Tax Total Amount
SNo Item Code Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise Amount(ININR) (ININR)
1 7000072 94051090 Others LIGHT FIXTURES AS EACH 7,35,300.00 1 18.00  0.00 0 735300.00
PERANNEXURE
2 7000072 94051090 Others TRANSPORTATION EACH 47,500.00 1 18.00 _ 0.00 0 47500.00
Total Unit 2.00
INSTALLATION TFS SCOPE. PAYMENT TERMS 50% ADVANCE BALANCE 50% POST 30 DAYS OF INVOICE SUBMISSION Total Taxable INR 7,82,800.00
Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 1,40,904.00
a) Products to be Supplied by b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00
Supplier at own cost
c) Delivery schedule to be d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 0.00
taken from the Buyer before ~ DELIVERY ADDRESS.
Despatching the mater
e) The Payment of taxes will
be Released once the Taxes is
Credited to our Account or the
GST Portal
Total INR Incl. Taxes 9,23,704.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority. If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at the earliest.
Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.
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Sarvesh Patil

From: Gaurav Dewan

Sent: 09 August 2023 12:27

To: Stephen P

Cc: Binu Balachandran; Lovejot Sekhon; Murchana Devi; Manish Thakkar; Amol Dandekar; Suraj
Kumbhar; Shama Nair; Sarvesh Patil

Subject: Re: Queries on lights for Jamies, BB & Irish House

Okay with me

Best,

Gaurav Dewan
+91 96655 15000

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Date: Tuesday, 8 August 2023 at 7:11 PM

To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>, Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>, Manish
Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>, Amol Dandekar <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>, Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>, Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Queries on lights for Jamies, BB & Irish House

Dear Sir,

Enclosed Revised Work order docket for Lights required at Irish House — Bangalore.
There is a change in vendor Allison Lighting to J C LUMIERES. As Allison light stepped back.
Request your approval to proceed further.

Lights
Irish and
522 | 000695 | JCLUMIERES | TFSPL BLR T2 nso | House | Fixtures | 782,800 | 717,400 9% 833,900 984,002 50%
Regards
Stephen

From: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 08 August 2023 18:41

To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <|lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Murchana Devi
<murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Amol Dandekar <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Queries on lights for Jamies, BB & Irish House

Approved

Regards,
Shama Nair

On 08-Aug-2023, at 16:43, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Shama,

As discussed with Stephen, we are re issuing the order for Irish house Lights on J C LUMIERES as earlier vendor Allison Lighting backed out last
moment saying he can’t deliver due to personal (medical) reasons

Please find attach work order of J C LUMIERES request you to kindly approve to proceed further

Lights
Irish and
522 | 000695 | JCLUMIERES | TFSPL BLR T2 nso House | Fixtures | 782,800 | 717,400 9% 833,900 984,002 50%




Regards
Sarvesh Patil

From: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 04 August 2023 11:28

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Murchana Devi
<murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Amol Dandekar
<amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj
Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Queries on lights for Jamies, BB & Irish House

Okay with me
Best,

Gaurav Dewan
+91 96655 15000

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>
Date: Thursday, 3 August 2023 at 4:30 PM

To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>, Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Murchana Devi
<murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>, Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>, Amol Dandekar
<amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>, Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>, Suraj
Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Queries on lights for Jamies, BB & Irish House

Dear Sir,

Enclosed Work order docket for Lights required at Irish House — Bangalore.
Request your approval to proceed further.

522 000695 | Allison Lightings Corporation | TFSPL BLR T2 nso Irish House | Lights and Fixtures | 832,850 833,900 984,002

Regards
Stephen

From: Amol Dandekar <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 03 August 2023 16:03

To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <|ovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Murchana
Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Queries on lights for Jamies, BB & Irish House

Dear Sarvesh

Approved from my side.
Thanks

Best regards

Amol Dandekar

From: Sarvesh Patil

Sent: Thursday, August 3, 2023 1:34 PM

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Amol Dandekar <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <|ovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Murchana
Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Queries on lights for Jamies, BB & Irish House

Dear Shama/Amol,
Please find the enclosed work order for Light Fixtures required for Irish House.

Request you to approve to proceed further.



JC Lumeriers )R1)

Sr.No. | Service/ WBS WBS Level 2 Short Item Item Description Qty. of
Materials Description Furniture Image /Images Units ltems RATE Total Amount
Code
1 Light Light Fixture Ceiling 600mm x 600mm |S&I of 36W LED Panel Light fixture of
Fixture mounted LED Panel Light. [600mm x 600mm. Remarkably slim at
12.5mm, in warm white 3000K.
Complete with led driver. All have a
white trim 595mm x 595mm standard Nos 10 1,750 17,500
suspended ceiling size.
2 Light Light Fixture Hanging 100mm dia x S&I of lukp make Metal tube with dalli
Fixture 200mm ht dimmable LED, suspended with 2.5mtr
hallow Pipe fulham driver dali. tptp
make with fulham driver. 12W
Nos 20 4,100 82,000
3 Light Light Fixture Pendant | 600mm to 750mm [TPT hng wooden barrel with Dalli
Fixture decorative | Height, Dia 370 to |dimmable 20wt LED panel top closed,
450mm, natural |bottom open, suspended with 2.5mtr
wooden light.  [hallow pipe
Nos 14 19,950 2,79,300
4 Light Light Fixture Pendant | 600mm to 750mm [TPT Barrel with top & bottom closed,
Fixture decorative | Height, Dia 370 to |no LED (kept on rack)
450mm, natural
wooden light.
Nos 1 17,000 1,87,000
5 Light Light Fixture | Wall Panel - | 150mm Height, Dia |[TPT Wall barrel with writing/ stickering,
Fixture Light Fixture [ 400 to 475mm, |similar to image NO LED
natural wooden
panel.
Nos 12 8,500 1,02,000
7 Light Light Fixture | LED Linear LED Linear strip  |S&I of LED strip light, 5 watt/ Mtr, pr——
Fixture strip warm white & flexible. With required
driver for each 3 Mtr, with profile
RMT 150 450 67,500
2 b
Total 7,35,300
Transportation 47,500
Packing
Installation
GST 1,40,904
Total 9,23,704
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Alison Lights (R2) JC Lumeriers )R1) Ace Li Mysore Light Lowest
Sr. No. | Service / WBS WBS Level 2 Short Item Item Description Qty. of
Materials Description Furniture Image /Images Units ftems RATE Total Amount RATE Total Amount RATE Total Amount RATE Total Amount RATE Total Amount
Code.
1 Light Light Fixture Ceiling 600mm x 600mm |S&I of 36W LED Panel Light fixture of
Fixture mounted LED Panel Light. [600mm x 600mm. Remarkably slim at
12.5mm, in warm white 3000K.
Complete with led driver. All have a
white trim 595mm x 595mm standard Nos 10 1,450 14,500 [ 1,750 17,500 | 2,800 28,000 [ 2,950 29,500 1,450 14,500
suspended ceiling size.
2 Light Light Fixture Hanging 100mm dia x S&I of lukp make Metal tube with dalli
Fixture 200mm ht dimmable LED, suspended with 2.5mtr
hallow Pipe fulham driver dali. tptp
make with fulham driver. 12W
Nos 20 5,500 1,10,000| 4,100 82,000 | 4,400 88,000 2,450 49,000 2,450 49,000
3 Light Light Fixture Pendant | 600mm to 750mm |TPT hng wooden barrel with Dalli
Fixture decorative | Height, Dia 370 to [dimmable 20wt LED panel top closed,
450mm, natural [bottom open, suspended with 2.5mtr
wooden light.  [hallow pipe
Nos 14 21,500 3,01,000( 19,950 2,79,300| 32,000 4,48,000| 22,000 3,08,000| 19,950 2,79,300
4 Light Light Fixture Pendant [ 600mm to 750mm |TPT Barrel with top & bottom closed,
Fixture decorative | Height, Dia 370 to [no LED (kept on rack)
450mm, natural
wooden light.
Nos 1" 17,500 1,92,500( 17,000 1,87,000( 30,000 3,30,000| 22,000 2,42,000| 17,000 1,87,000
5 Light Light Fixture | Wall Panel - | 150mm Height, Dia|TPT Wall barrel with writing/
Fixture Light Fixture | 400 to 475mm, (stickering, similar to image NO LED
natural wooden
panel.
Nos 12 7,300 87,600 | 8,500 1,02,000 ( 24,000 2,88,000( 13,500 1,62,000( 7,300 87,600
7 Light Light Fixture | LED Linear LED Linear strip |S&I of LED strip light, 5 watt/ Mtr, &
Fixture strip warm white & flexible. With required T
driver for each 3 Mtr, with profile
RMT 150 475 71,250 450 67,500 350 52,500| 1,350 2,02,500 350 52,500
»
anw
Total 7,76,850 7,35,300 12,34,500 9,93,000 6,69,900
Transportation 56,000 47,500 At Actuals At Actuals 47,500
Packing
Installation TFS Scope
GST 1,49,913 1,340,904 2,22,210 1,78,740 1,29,132
Total 9,82,763 9,23,704 14,56,710 11,71,740 8,46,532

Page 1 of 1

10%



