Ramendra Singh

From: sudhir gaikwad <pacificinnovatesudhir@gmail.com>
Sent: 15 August 2024 22:53

To: Ramendra Singh

Subject: Re: Discount on Hand Pallet Truck Repairing work cost

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ramendra,
Ok with a 5% discount.

Regards,
Sudhir Gaikwad

On Wed, Aug 14, 2024 at 11:58 AM Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Sudhir,

As discussed with you kindly give us 5 % discount as we discussed on over all



SR.NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY RATE AMOUNT
1 LOAD WHEEL 28 400 11200
2 OIL SEAL SET 10 650 6500
3 PUSH ROD 1 1150 1150
4 HANDLE CHAIN 4 300 1200
5 STEERING WHEEL 4 650 2600
6 BEARING 56 120 6720
A PUSH ROD PIN 1 175 175
8 SPRING CAP 3 215 645
9 SERVICE CHANGE 17 600 10200
10 HYDRAULIC OIL 8 LTR 160 1280
11 LOAD WHEEL SHAFT 8 225 1800
TOTAL AMOUNT| 43470
Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677




