Abdul Rehman

From: rohini steelcraft <rohini.steelcraft@gmail.com>

Sent: 24 April 2024 13:10

To: Abdul Rehman

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; SteelCraft FoodService Equipments
Subject: Re: KFC Requirement - Ahmedabad

Attachments: SC_APRIL_22_Travel_Food_services_Private_Limited.pdf
Dear Sir,

Please find the attached PL

Thanks & Regards,

Rohini Mane.
Contact No: 99700 30391

Steelcraft Food Service Equipments Pvt Ltd.

On Sat, Apr 20, 2024 at 6:58 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Partners,

Request you to kindly share quote for the below mentioned equipment for our upcoming KFC Outet in Ahemdabad.

S.No.|EQUIPMENT Dimension QTY.|Category
10 |SS SHELF ABOVE 925mm300 1 [Fabrication




18 [PACK TABLE WITH DRAWER WARMER [850mm1325mm-| 1 |Fabrication
19 |TOASTER TABLE FOR VEG 375mm900mm- 1 [Fabrication
20 [TOASTER TABLE FOR NON VEG 375mm900mm- 1 [Fabrication
21 |BUN TROLLEY 700mm650mm- 1 |Fabrication
22 (BIB RACK 570mm610mm- 1 [Fabrication
23 |INON-VEG HOOD 1 [Fabrication
24 |VEGHOOD 1 [Fabrication
25 |HAND WASH Sink 2 |Fabrication
26 (BT SINK 1 [Fabrication
27 (3 BOWL SINK 1 [Fabrication
28 [SS SHELVES ABOVE SINK 1 |Fabrication
29 |DIRTY DISH LANDING 1  |Fabrication
30 |[MOP SINK 1 [Fabrication
31 |PACK TABLE 1 [Fabrication
32 |TABLE RACK COOK AREA 1 [Fabrication
33 [CHEMICAL RACK 1 [Fabrication
35 [THAWING RACK (WALK IN CHILLER) 2 |Fabrication
DRY LOCKABLE
37 |SS STORAGE (DAILY USE) 1 [Fabrication
38 |SERVER RACK 1 [Fabrication

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

H | & +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.







