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Abdul Rehman

From: rohini steelcraft <rohini.steelcraft@gmail.com>
Sent: 15 April 2024 15:42
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; SteelCraft FoodService Equipments
Subject: Re: International Food Hall - Requirement
Attachments: SC_APRIL_12_Travel_Food_services_Private_Limited (1).pdf

Dear Sir, 
 
please find the attached proforma Invoice. 
 
 
 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Rohini Mane. 
Contact No: 99700 30391 
Steelcraft Food Service Equipments Pvt Ltd. 
----------------------------------------------------------------- 
 
 
On Mon, Apr 15, 2024 at 12:46 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Partners,  

  

Need quote for floor standing electric Dimsum Steamer.  

  

DESCRIPTION 
OVERALL 

SIZE QTY 
Floor Standing Electric Dim Sum Steamer. (7 
kw) 400 x 700 x 850 3 
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Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 
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📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  


