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Ramendra Singh

From: SILVER EQUIPMENTS <silverequipmentsmum@gmail.com>
Sent: 07 June 2024 12:43
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; Ramendra Singh; NAEEM SHAIKH
Subject: Re: Copper Chimney R City Fabrication BOQ
Attachments: SE-323 TRAVEL FOOD SERVICE PVT LTD.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 
the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear All Please Find The Revised Quotation Below 
 
On Thu, 6 Jun 2024 at 18:51, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Naseem Ji,  

  

PFA equipment file with Target rates. Request you to kindly check and share you no regret prices.   

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: SILVER EQUIPMENTS <silverequipmentsmum@gmail.com>  
Sent: 06 June 2024 15:15 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Ramendra 
Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; NAEEM SHAIKH <shaikhnaeem1971@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Copper Chimney R City Fabrication BOQ 

  

Dear All Please Find The Attached Quotation Below 

  

On Thu, 6 Jun 2024 at 11:17, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

HI Naseem Ji,  

 You don't often get email from silverequipmentsmum@gmail.com. Learn why this is important  
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PFA drawings for missing equipment  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: SILVER EQUIPMENTS <silverequipmentsmum@gmail.com>  
Sent: 01 June 2024 15:23 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Ramendra 
Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> 
Subject: Re: Copper Chimney R City Fabrication BOQ 

  

Dear All We Haven't Received Drawings For Items Mentioned Below Please Provide Drawings For 
Quotation  

Outlet Name SR NO Item Name 

CC R CIty MK - 05 Sigri Guard For Roomali Roti Unit 
CC R CIty MK - 10 Skewer Hanging Rod with dripping tray 
CC R CIty MK - 20 G/ N pan Rack To Accommodate 1/2 G/N Pans 
CC R CIty MK - 21 Condiment Trolley 
CC R CIty MK - 23 Single Sink Unit 
CC R CIty MK - 25 Hot Bain Marie with One OHS ( GN PAN SIZE MISSING ) 
CC R CIty MK - 33 Clean Dish Storage Rack - 5 Shelves ( 3 Sides Up and 1 Side Down ) With Space For keeping Linen Trolley 
CC R CIty MK - 34 Soiled Linen Dispose Trolley 
CC R CIty PW - 03 Pot Rack - 3 Shelves - No Bottom Shelve 
CC R CIty DW- 02 Pre Rinse Sink Unit 
CC R CIty DW - 05 Unloading Table With 2 Undershelves 
CC R CIty DW - 06 Wiping Table With 2 U/S 
CC R CIty DG -01 SS Drain Grating 
CC R CIty DG -02 SS Drain Grating 
CC R CIty DG -02 SS Drain Grating 
CC R CIty BA - 03 Single Sink With Speed Rail 
CC R CIty BA - 04 Work Table With Cross Bracing 
CC R CIty BS - 02 SS STORAGE RACK 
CC R CIty BS - 03 SS STORAGE RACK 
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On Fri, 31 May 2024 at 13:32, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Partners,  

  

Request you to kindly share the quote for our Upcoming Copper Chimney Outlet at R city.  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

 
 

  

--  

Thanks & Regards, 

Naeem Shaikh (Anees) 

 

Mfg. Of COMMERCIAL KITCHEN EQUIPMENT & REFRIGERATORS 

E-Mail: silverequipmentsmum@gmail.com 

Mob- 9892384181 / 9702883656 

  

 
 

  

--  

Thanks & Regards, 

Naeem Shaikh (Anees) 
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Mfg. Of COMMERCIAL KITCHEN EQUIPMENT & REFRIGERATORS 

E-Mail: silverequipmentsmum@gmail.com 

Mob- 9892384181 / 9702883656 

  

 
 
 
--  
Thanks & Regards,  
Naeem Shaikh (Anees) 

 
Mfg. Of COMMERCIAL KITCHEN EQUIPMENT & REFRIGERATORS 
E-Mail: silverequipmentsmum@gmail.com 
Mob- 9892384181 / 9702883656 
 


