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Abdul Rehman

From: SHIKHA KATHURIA <shikhaindustries18@gmail.com>
Sent: 16 April 2024 11:47
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar
Subject: Re: International Food Hall - Requirement

Dear Abdul Ji, 
 
Our final price is 52500/- please consider this & share the PO for the same. 
 
On Tue, Apr 16, 2024 at 11:14 AM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Amit ji,  

  

Target price for the dim sum steamer will be 50000 rs. We request you to kindly share your no regret price.  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: SHIKHA KATHURIA <shikhaindustries18@gmail.com>  
Sent: 15 April 2024 20:34 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: International Food Hall - Requirement 

  

Dear Abdul Ji, 
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Electric Dim Sum Steamer cost is approx 54000/- per pcs. Gst & cartage extra  

  

On Mon, Apr 15, 2024 at 12:46 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Partners,  

  

Need quote for floor standing electric Dimsum Steamer.  

  

DESCRIPTION 
OVERALL 

SIZE QTY 
Floor Standing Electric Dim Sum Steamer. (7 
kw) 400 x 700 x 850 3 
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Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
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--  

With Warm Regards ! 

  

SHIKHA INDUSTRIES 

  

Plot no.20A/8, Ground Floor, Dhanda Complex 

N.I.T Industrial Area, Faridabad-121001 

Ph.No- 9711529009, 9210245693 

  

 
 
 
--  
With Warm Regards ! 
 
SHIKHA INDUSTRIES 
 
Plot no.20A/8, Ground Floor, Dhanda Complex 
N.I.T Industrial Area, Faridabad-121001 
Ph.No- 9711529009, 9210245693 
 


