SV ENGINEERING

\ e PLOT;§ VINAYAGA NAGAR EXT,VINAYAGAPURAM, TAMILNADU,CHENNAL-600099
ENGINEERING Mail id;svengineerinh2402@gmail.com, Cell no;6380041179
Invoice No: 136
BILL TO
Invoice Date: 13-Dec-2022
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PVT LTD, TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PVT LTD,
LINK BUILDING OLD DEPATURE TERMINAL AIRPORT CHENNAI
AIRPORT CHENNAI NET0
GST;33AAECT8192M1ZS PO;NO CHN/PO/22-23/002716
SL;NO DESCRIPTION HSN-SAC [QTY NOS| UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 STAFF LOCKER (18/20 GAUGE) 83030 8 19,350.00 135,450.00
18 COMPARTMENTS
SUBTOTAL 154,800.00
TRANSPORT -
CGST| 9% 13,932.00
SGST| 9% 13,932.00
o -
Thank you for your business! O8T| 16%
ROUND OFF 5
GRASS TOTAL 182,664.90
®\ FOR; SV ENGINEERI
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OUT SOURCING / MANUFACTURING / FABRICATION / MACHINING / ASSEy'{Y /

MATERIAL SOURCING &
GST:

33GBKPS5909F1ZC / 12-03-2019.

lravel Foed Services Cheanni Pvt. Lid.
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Yaendor No, voooonp22

Purchase Order
Order Number CHN/POJ22-2370027 16

Tnvaice Location
Ivavel Food Services Chennai P

Shipped Location

Travel Food Services Chennai PyLLLd Gravnd Floor, Second Fluor Thivd Flopr

Page Nov 1
L0/ 102022 7:35:52 1M

rate Address
00D SERVICES CHENNAI PIOVATE

LIMITED
Central Kitchen, Next to §2 Police Station ,
Chennai International Airport,

SV ENGINEERING Ground Floor, Second FloorIhisd Floor & City 8 City side
NOS VINAYAGANAGAIL, VINAYAGAPURAM side Kamaraf Domestic Terminal,Chennai CHENNAL 600027
[Eanuoaj Domestic Terminal,Chennai AtrportTirusoka
Tirnvatlur, 600099 Airport, Tirusula Honuzz State Ex}
India CHENNAL 600027 Inlist
Tdia India N State Name Tamil Nadu
AN, No. GHKIPS5909 1 India Comp GST No. FANAECTRIDZMLZS
State Cnde KK Contact Person GETIN No. ABAALCTRIO2MZS
State Name Tl Nadn Contaact No. ganrav.bhagaliya@ivavellonds Requisition No.
E-Mail el OfANENIR2 panravhhagatiya@avelfondservices.co po Entey Date 10/10/2022
Vendos GSTNO.  $3GBRPSSO0911ZC ETA: i
Vendor v, No. fayment Terms  Net 30 dlays
Vendor Fax No.
HSN\SAC Tolal Tax Total Amount
SNo _ltem Code  Code  Ilem Deseription Description 2 Item Category uoM Unit Cost Qy  GST% VAT % Excise Amount(ININR)  (ININI)
1 oz 1101 Others Overbead FACH 19,350.00 15 oo 000 0 290250.00
Expenses
2 2000456 W67 FREIGHT CHARGES Olher Hon COGS EACH 200000 1 1800 000 0 200000
Tatal Unil fa.nn
Payment Tenns - 0% Advance & 30% After Delivery, Material Descdption - STAFF LOCKER 10-20 GAUGE 18 Tolal Taxable INIU 292,250.00
COMPARTMENTS - 900 X 450 X 1950 MM = 15 NOS; Department - HIR, PRI200-22-21, Oullal - St1aff Wellare.
Excise Amount 0.00
COST Amonnt 26,302.50
SGST Amount 26,302,50
a) Products to be Supplied by ) Any duficiancy In Documants and Process will be liability of lhe supplier only Cess 0.00
Supplier al own cost
©) Delivery schedule 1o be o) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL 10 T 1L 0.0y
taken fion the Buyer before  DELIVERY ADDRESS.
Despatching the mater
e) The Payment of taxes will
be Released ance the Taxes is
Credited (o our Account or
the GST Portal
144,855,00

Diselaimor - Unless informad lo us It Is assumed Ihal you ara nol registered as MSME wilh (he respeclive

Total INIt Incl, Taxe

Ihe varliest. Allernatively once you gel registerad then provide us relevan! proof lo updale our records.

government authorily. I you hava nol yel provided Ihe MSME delalls along wilh proof kindly provide the saime sl
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12/16/22, 3:56_PM RE: PO for HO Approvals October 2022 - Chennai Purchase - Outlook
From: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan(@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Saturday, 5 November, 2022, 17:18

To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat(@k-corp.in>; Shauvik Modak <shauvik.modak@k-corp.in>

Ce¢: Azmath Baig <azmath baig@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: PO for HO Approvals October 2022

Okay with me
Best,

Gaurav Dewan
+91 96655 15000

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Date: Wednesday, 2 November 2022 at 1:15 PM

To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>, Shauvik Modak <shauvik.modak@k-corp.in>
Cc: Azmath Baig <azmath.baig@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: PO for HO Approvals October 2022

Dear Sirs,

Please find updates on Chennal Pending PO , We will also organize call with Azmath for further updates & clarification today

about:blank

PO received to
HO Purchase Payment Payment
Dept. Name PR No PO/ WO No Vendor Name Item Description PO DATE team Po Amount Type Terms
PEG MEASURES &
WEIGHING SCALE
YEARLY STAMPING AFTER
R&M VIAY MAIL CHN/PO/22-23/2052 RR SYSTEMS & SOLUTION | WORKS 12-0ct-22 26-0ct-22 30,857 | DELIVERY
HR VIIAY 200-22-23 CHN/PQ/22-23/2716 SV ENGINEERING STAFF LOCKER 10-Oct-22 26-Oct-22 344,855 | ADVANCE 70%
CLASSIQUE KITCHEN &
OPERATIONS VIJAY 130-22-23 CHN/PO/22-23/2730 BAKERY EQUIPMET MINI HOT CASE 11-Oct-22 26-0ct-22 84,046 | ADVANCE 100%
HOUSE KEEPING
UNIFORMS FOR
HR VIAY 140-22-23 CHN/PO/22-23/2896 ACMI FASHION DESIGNER | FEMALE 19-Oct-22 26-Oct-22 311,850 | ADVANCE 70%
HOT FOOOD CASE-
SANKESHWAR RED 9 LTRS 7 15 LTRS AFTER
PRODUCTION VIIAY 152-22-23 CHN/PO/22-23/2969 SELECTIONS - 30 EACH 22-0ct-22 26-0ct-22 492,060 | DELIVERY
PRODUCTION ViAY 069-22-23 CHN/PO/22-23/2997 PHOENIX AGENCIES BOSCH JET MACHINE 25-Oct-22 26-0ct-22 49,442 | ADVANCE 100%
HR VIIAY 186-22-23 CHN/PO/22-23/3005 ASIAN CARDS TFS LANYARD 25:0ct-22 26-Oct-22 28,000 | ADVANCE 100%
VEG & NON-VEG AFTER
R&M VIAY 144-22-23 CHN/PO/22-23/3008 SV ENGINEERING SEPARATION TRAY S5 25-0ct-22 26-Oct-22 88,052 | DELIVERY
GN PAN LAZER AFTER
PRODUCTION VuAY 082-22-23 CHN/PO/22-23/3011 SV ENGINEERING ENGRAVING WORK 25-Oct-22 26-Oct-22 19,914 | DELIVERY
VCC SPARE &
R&M VHAY 162-22-23 CHN/PQ/22-23/3013 MASTER SERVICES SERVICE WORK 25-Oct-22 26-Oct-22 127,714 | ADVANCE 70%
1N



