SINGLE VENDOR DECLARATION

Date: 28/06/2024

PO No: Semolina/PO/24-25/000560

Vendor Name: Lok Pratik Construction

Product Description: Civil & Electrical
Work

Unit / Project Name: MUM T1 CENTRAL KITCHEN -JB Nagar

Justification:

Only known supplier. (List of the suppliers which were contacted
below and the specific reasons why each was not a viable source).

As per instruction received from
management, proceeding the PO on
recommended vendor and finalized rates.

Only known qualified supplier or item. (List the qualifications
that each source or items meet. If another supplier offers a similar
item, provide the item identification, supplier information and
comparable pricing).

Supplier proprietary item. (The selected supplier is the only
manufacturer of this item. List the reasons why no substitute item
can be used and if no similar item is available).

Franchise / Management / User Dept Directed. (Provide a copy
of letter, or memo or e-mail specifically directing this source)

Item / Rate Contracted. (Provide copy of the contract /
agreement)As per urgent requirement by team negotiated with best
rate and released order for the same.

Prepared By
Sarvesh Patil
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Approved By
Akshay Sharma




Sarvesh Patil

From: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: 01 July 2024 12:33

To: Sarvesh Patil

Cc: Sunil Ghosal; Lovejot Sekhon; Benjamin Yejman; Manish Thakkar; Ameet Koomar; Rajesh
Shetty; Aijaz Naim; Ramendra Singh; Ashish Nagar

Subject: RE: T1 A | Shifting of TFS from T1A

Approved

From: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Sent: Monday, July 1, 2024 12:15 PM

To: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Sunil Ghosal <sunil.ghosal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Benjamin
Yejman <yejman.benjamin@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Ameet Koomar
<Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Aijaz Naim <aijaz.naim@k-corp.in>;
Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: T1 A | Shifting of TFS from T1A

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender
and know the content is safe.

Dear Akshay Sir,
All commercials have been Finalised we are awaiting your approval on The SVD shared to submit PO for approval.
Re sharing for your reference, request you to approve the same.

Thanks & Regards,
Sarvesh Patil

From: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: 29 June 2024 19:05

To: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Cc: Sunil Ghosal <sunil.ghosal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Benjamin Yejman
<yejman.benjamin@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Ameet Koomar
<Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Aijaz Naim <aijaz.naim@k-corp.in>;
Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: T1 A | Shifting of TFS from T1A

Hi Team
PIs help to release the PO for the central kitchen at the earliest. We need to start the work and move in next 1 week.

Regards
Akshay
Get Outlook for i0S

From: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Saturday, June 29, 2024 5:56 PM

To: Sarvesh Patil K-Corp <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>
Cc: Sunil Ghosal <sunil.ghosal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>;
Benjamin Yejman <yejman.benjamin@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-
corp.in>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>;

1



