Ramendra Singh

From: SK TRADERS <sktraders442@yahoo.com>

Sent: 06 November 2024 16:19

To: Ramendra Singh

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma; Herambraj Sonawane

Subject: Re: Qtn required for 24 Inch Wall Mouted fan& Exhoust fan

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir

freight charges 2000/-

Thanks & Regards

S. K. Traders
Mo. 9250629173

On Wednesday, November 6, 2024 at 02:30:24 AM PST, Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>
wrote:

Pls share the freight charges

From: SK TRADERS <sktraders442@yahoo.com>

Sent: 06 November 2024 15:57

To: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>; Herambraj Sonawane
<mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Qtn required for 24 Inch Wall Mouted fan& Exhoust fan

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir



Item Qty RATE
Almonard 12 inch Heavy Duty Single Phase EXHOUST

FAN 2 | 2800/-
almonard 24 Inch 600MM Air Circulator 600 mm 3
Blade Wall Fan (Ultra High Speed | Green ) 2 | 9100/-

GST EXTRA 18%

CARTAGE EXTRA

Thanks & Regards
S. K. Traders

Mo. 9250629173

On Monday, November 4, 2024 at 11:59:09 PM PST, Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Partners,

Kindly share the below Item Qtn for given location

Item Qty Delivery location
Almonard 12 inch Heavy Duty Single Phase

EXHOUST FAN 2 | Kurla Mumabai
almonard 24 Inch 600MM Air Circulator 600 mm 3

Blade Wall Fan (Ultra High Speed | Green ) 2 | Kurla Mumabai

Wall Fan



Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh
9999118677



