Ramendra Singh

From: Govind Somvanshi <govindsgew@gmail.com>
Sent: 30 August 2024 13:30

To: Ramendra Singh

Subject: Re: Give us 10 % discount

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Ok, You can consider 10 % discount.
Thanks & Regards.

Mr.Govind Somvanshi .
Proprietor

On Fri, 30 Aug 2024, 12:32 pm Ramendra Singh, <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Govind ji,

As discussed please find below required Qty & Attached Qtn kindly gives 10% discount as per given wotking

S.G Engineering works

Item Set . Amt
Rate perset [ Amt | Discount 10% | Ratel |1

Service Trolley wheel PU wheel 5”

plate type movable With breaks(red,white) 2550 | 12750 255 | 2295 | 11475




H.K Trolley wheel PU wheel 5 Movable(Red, White)

Size: 57 x 1 V4" 4 2550 | 10200 2551 2295| 9180
Food trolley wheel rubber 4” ,Plate type, movable with break 5 2150 [ 10750 215 1935| 9675
Food Trolley wheel 4” PU Movable type
Size:4” x 1 V4 6 2150 [ 12900 215 1935] 11610
GI Nutbolt 5-16 *3-4 and washer 50 Nos 50 15 750 1.5 13.5 675
Total 47350 42615
Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677




