Ramendra Singh

From: Rupa Steel Centre <rupasteelcentre@gmail.com>

Sent: 23 September 2024 17:15

To: Rajesh Ratna

Cc: Ramendra Singh; Ajit Singh; shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in
Subject: Re: Qtn required for Ahmedabad & Lucknow

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

As discussed, kindly add 10% discount on wet machine only And release the purchase order

Thanking You
Regards,

Harsh Shah
Co-founder | Rupa Steel Centre

+91 9737 000 787
u p'l www.amazon.in/rupasnest

rupasteelcentre@gmail.com
At/po.Paria, Via.Udwada,Tal.Pardi,
Dist.Valsad (Gujarat) India 396145
(Owner) 24ARBPS2476E1ZV

"Taj mahal would not been so Beautiful and Everlasting if shahjahan had asked for
the quotation and decide for the lowest."

On Mon, 23 Sep 2024 at 4:49 PM, Rajesh Ratna <rajesh.ratna@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

40 L, 22kg capacity, Confirmed, thank you.

Regards.

From: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: Monday, September 23, 2024 3:25 PM

To: Rajesh Ratna <rajesh.ratna@semolinakitchens.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>
Cc: shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in; Rupa Steel Centre <rupasteelcentre @gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Qtn required for Ahmedabad & Lucknow




Dear Rajesh ji,

As per our discussion please find attached Specification for Wet Grinder against for PR no: Semolina-2425-00785 kindly
confirm the model as attached

Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677

From: Rupa Steel Centre <rupasteelcentre@gmail.com>

Sent: 23 September 2024 15:19

To: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>
Cc: shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in

Subject: Re: Qtn required for Ahmedabad & Lucknow

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Below attached is the specification for Wet Grinder

Thanking You

Regards,



Harsh Shah
Co-founder | Rupa Steel Centre

+91 9737 000 787
u p' www.amazon.in/rupasnest

rupasteelcentre@gmail.com

At/po.Paria, Via.Udwada,Tal.Pardi,
Dist.Valsad (Gujarat) India 396145
(Owner)

24ARBPS2476E1ZV

"Taj mahal would not been so Beautiful and Everlasting if shahjahan had asked for
the quotation and decide for the lowest."

On Sat, Sep 21, 2024 at 5:43 PM Rupa Steel Centre <rupasteelcentre(@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Namaskar!!

Note:
1. Stock status: ON ORDER
2. Order once placed cannot be cancelled.
3. Transport & GST will be extra as applicable and mentioned.
4. Payment Terms: Strictly ADVANCE from date of delivery.
5. Delivery time will be informed once the order is confirmed.
6. Rates Valid only for 7 Days or till available stock.
7. Packing, Delivery, Insurance & Accessories will be extra.

8. Lead time for dispatch 3-4 working days if ready stock

Thanking You

Regards,



Harsh Shah
Co-founder | Rupa Steel Centre

+91 9737 000 787
u p'l www.amazon.in/rupasnest

rupasteelcentre@gmail.com

At/po.Paria, Via.Udwada,Tal.Pardi,
Dist.Valsad (Gujarat) India 396145
(Owner)

24ARBPS2476E1ZV

"Taj mahal would not been so Beautiful and Everlasting if shahjahan had asked
for the quotation and decide for the lowest."

| On Tue, Sep 17, 2024 at 4:25 PM Rupa Steel Centre <rupasteelcentre@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Namaskar!!

1. Stock status: ON ORDER

2. Order once placed cannot be cancelled.

3. Transport & GST will be extra as applicable and mentioned.
4. Payment Terms: Strictly ADVANCE from date of delivery.
5. Delivery time will be informed once the order is confirmed.
6. Rates Valid only for 7 Days or till available stock.

7. Packing, Delivery, Insurance & Accessories will be extra.

8. Lead time for dispatch 3-4 working days if ready stock

Thanking You



Regards,

Harsh Shah
Co-founder | Rupa Steel Centre

+91 9737 000 787
u p'l www.amazon.in/rupasnest

rupasteelcentre@gmail.com

At/po.Paria, Via.Udwada,Tal.Pardi,
Dist.Valsad (Gujarat) India 396145
(Owner)

24ARBPS2476E1ZV

"Taj mahal would not been so Beautiful and Everlasting if shahjahan had asked
for the quotation and decide for the lowest."

| | On Tue, Sep 17, 2024 at 1:56 PM Rupa Steel Centre <rupasteelcentre@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

please confirm the below machine so we can quote you accurately

1) Rice Grinder



2) Table Top

Thanking You

Regards,



Harsh Shah
Co-founder | Rupa Steel Centre

+91 9737 000 787
u p' www.amazon.in/rupasnest

rupasteelcentre@gmail.com

At/po.Paria, Via.Udwada,Tal.Pardi,
Dist.Valsad (Gujarat) India 396145
(Owner)

24ARBPS2476E1ZV

"Taj mahal would not been so Beautiful and Everlasting if shahjahan had asked
for the quotation and decide for the lowest."

On Tue, Sep 17, 2024 at 1:54 PM Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Partners,

Kindly share the below item qtn

1.Rice grinder machine 40 liter per hour, SS makes ( Idli Batter Machine ) Qty-1 delivery address-
Ahmedabad airport

2. Table top Dosa batter machine Qty-1 Delivery address-Lucknow airport

Thanks & Regards,

Ramendra Singh

9999118677



