Swapnil Sutar

From: riya sales <riya.salesO1@gmail.com>

Sent: 26 July 2024 17:02

To: Swapnil Sutar

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Abdul Rehman; Rishabh Rawal
Subject: Re: Need quote for Almirah

Dear Swapnil,

Greetings from RIYA SALES !!

Pfa rates.
EQ SR. No DESCRIPTION OVERALL SIZE| Model No |[QTY|Category| Remarks PRICE
TOP,SHELF &
1 S.S. ALMIRAH 36X24X72 CUSTOM MAKE 1 Fabrication DCO(;)VRESR_I’],\?S_A 43750/-
20GA

THANKS AND REGARDS
RISHABH RAWAL
RIYA SALES

2 Riya Salesﬁ

Rye

On Thu, Jul 25, 2024 at 6:18 PM Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote:

1




HI Sir,

Please quote -

Almirah 2 Door 18 Gauge Sheet

Almirah 2 door 16-18-gauge sheet heavy duty 72 x 24 x 36 Inch

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
| & +919987022136

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



