Abdul Rehman

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Abdul Ji,

Greetings from RIYA SALES !!

riya sales <riya.salesO1@gmail.com>
10 May 2024 14:29

Abdul Rehman

Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; Ramendra Singh; Rishabh Rawal
Re: Dilli Street - Delhi T1

Kindly check the amount for Table Top Kulfi Faluda Freezer.

Outlet Name

EQ SR. No

DESCRIPTION

OVERALL SIZE

Model No

QTY

Category

Remarks

PRICE

Dilli Street

CH-05

TABLE TOP KULFI FALUDA FREEZER

600X500X450

CUSTOM MAKE

Fabrication

600X500X450

45000/-

THANKS AND REGARDS
RISHABH RAWAL
RIYA SALES

On Fri, May 10, 2024 at 2:09 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Dharmendra Ji,




PFB additional equipment requirement at Delhi T1 for Dilli Street Outlet. Please share the quote.

PR No

Outlet Name

EQ SR. No

DESCRIPTION

OVERALL SIZE

Model No

OTY

Category

Remarks

TFSPL-2425-00097

Dilli Street

CH-05

TABLE TOP KULFI FALUDA FREEZER

600X500X450

CUSTOM MAKE

Fabrication

600X500X450

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman
H| & +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.




