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Abdul Rehman

From: riya sales <riya.sales01@gmail.com>
Sent: 14 March 2024 12:51
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; Rishabh Rawal; Dharmender Rawal
Subject: Re: Una Fabrication Requirement
Attachments: UNA QUOTATION.xlsx

Hi Abdul Ji. 
Greetings from RIYA SALES !! 
 
Pfa Quotation with our best rates below against your new requirement. 
Kindly check & release P.O. with advance payment asap. 
 
THANKS AND REGARDS 
RISHABH RAWAL 
RIYA SALES 
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On Tue, Mar 12, 2024 at 2:03 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hello, 
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Please find below the equipment requirement for the upcoming outlet in Una. Kindly provide the quote as soon as possible. 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  


