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Ramendra Singh

From: riya sales <riya.sales01@gmail.com>
Sent: 19 June 2024 14:15
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Ramendra Singh; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp; Swapnil Sutar; Rishabh Rawal
Subject: Re: Fabrication Quotation required for Delhi Store
Attachments: RS_24_25_278_TRAVEL_FOOD_SERVICES_PRIVATE_LIMITED.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 
the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Abdul Ji, 
Greetings from RIYA SALES !! 
 
Pfa quotation below. 
Kindly check & release p.o. to start production asap. 
 
THANKS AND REGARDS 
RISHABH RAWAL 
RIYA SALES 

 
 
 
 
On Wed, Jun 19, 2024 at 12:20 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Team,  

  

PFB updated list with proper dimension and revised qtys.  

  

ITEM NAME Dimension UOM QTY 

3 Nos. 1 1 GN PAN 150 DEEP HOT BAIN MARIE INBUILT 
– Sunk in  

45 INCH X 26 INCH X  

12 INCH 
NOS 3 

1 1 GN PAN HOT BAIN MARIE 
19.5 INCH X 26 INCH X 
35 INCH 

NOS 2 



2

SS WORK TABLE WITH 2 U S (1200 x 600 x 
850+100SPL) All side open 

1200 x 600 x 850+100 NOS 10 

4 Nos. 1 1 GN PAN 150 DEEP HOT BAIN MARIE INBUILT 
Sunk in 

62.5 INCH X  26 INCH 
X 12 INCH 

NOS 1 

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>  
Sent: 19 June 2024 11:11 
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar 
<swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Fabrication Quotation required for Delhi Store 

  

Dear Partners, 

  

Kindly share the Quotation for below given item  

  

ITEM NAME Dimension UOM QTY 
Pallets 1200 mm x 1000 mm NOS 30.00 
3 Nos. 1 1 GN PAN 150 DEEP HOT BAIN MARIE INBUILT  45 INCH X 26 INCH  NOS 3.00 
1 1 GN PAN HOT BAIN MARIE 19.5 INCH X 26 INCH  NOS 1.00 
SS WORK TABLE WITH 2 U S (1200 x 600 x 
850+100SPL) 

1200 x 600 x 850+100 NOS 10.00 

4 Nos. 1 1 GN PAN 150 DEEP HOT BAIN MARIE INBUILT  62.5 INCH X  26 INCH NOS 1.00 

  

  

Thanks & Regards- 

Ramendra 



3

9999118677 

  


