Ramendra Singh

From: RELIABLE ENGG SERVICES RES <reliableengineering2016@gmail.com>
Sent: 13 August 2024 12:43

To: Ramendra Singh

Cc: shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in

Subject: Re: Discount of drain maesh & drain grill

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Ok sir

On Tue, 13 Aug, 2024, 12:40 pm Ramendra Singh, <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

As discussed please confirm the below 10% discount as discussed

Reliable Engg
Item Qty Rate | Amt 10% Discount Rate | Amt
SS 304 grade heavy duty drain grill 20 [ 4800 96000 480 | 4320 86400
SS 304 Heavy duty drain mesh 20 [ 3200 64000 320 | 2880 57600
Freight 1] 3000 3000 300 | 2700 2700
\ 163000 146700




Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677



