Ramendra Singh

From: RELIABLE ENGG SERVICES RES <reliableengineering2016@gmail.com>
Sent: 14 August 2024 11:25

To: Ramendra Singh

Cc: shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in

Subject: Re: Discount on work

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Ok sir

On Wed, 14 Aug, 2024, 10:56 am Ramendra Singh, <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Partners,

Kindly give us 10 % discount as per given below works & attached qtn for processing the order

Item

Qty

Rate

Amt

10%
Discount

Rate-1

Amt

6°X2> HEAVY DUTY BRACKET RUBBER BASE IMPORTED WHELS
SIZE; 6°X2>° 2B + 2WB

1480

11840

148

1332

10656

SS GARBAGE TROLLEY OUTER FRAME
MATERIAL,

304 25X25X1.6MM SQUARE TUBE
FABRICATION AND WELDING WORK

6000

6000

600

5400

5400

SS WELDING FOR GARBAGE TROLLEY WEELS OLD REMOVING
AND NEW INSTALATION




| Total | 17840 | | 16056 |

Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677



