Swapnil Sutar

From: riya sales <riya.salesO1@gmail.com>

Sent: 23 May 2024 18:12

To: Swapnil Sutar

Cc: Rishabh Rawal; Abdul Rehman; Sandeep Bhat

Subject: Re: FW: Need quote - TFS-2324-00074- Oven Trolly - UNA

Hi Swapnil,
Greetings from RIYA SALES !!

Kindly check the amount for Oven Trolley.

Outlet Name |EQ SR. No DESCRIPTION OVERALL SIZE| Model No |QTY|Category| Remarks | PRICE

UNA 1 OVEN TROLLEY 1274X1021X600 | CUSTOM MAKE [ 1 [ Fabrication 11750/-

THANKS AND REGARDS
RISHABH RAWAL
RIYA SALES

~Riya Sales

nufacturers of : Commercial Kitchen Equipments « Food Service Equipments

»Catering Equipmentse Hotels Equipments & Hospitals Equipments
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On Thu, May 23, 2024 at 5:51 PM Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote:
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Dear Sir,

Kindly share the quote as per Attached documents



