Herambraj Sonawane

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 5:58 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma; Ramendra Singh
Subject: Re: Qtn Jaquar ALD-CHR-563 Health Faucet
Sir

Please check below the rate against your inquiry

S.NO | HSN CODE PARTICULARS CLR QTY

) 84818020 ALD-CHR-563 - Health Chr 50
Faucet

Rate : 1050/- per + Gst

Terms & Conditions

Payment 100% Advance against PO

Delivery Dispatch 2-3 days from Payment Receipt



Freight & Forwarding Included.

Best Wishes,

M. A. Electrical Solutions

6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai — 400007.
Meghal Parikh

meghalparikh1969@gmail.com

+91-9930211622

Crystal Hospitality

info@crystal-hospitality.com

www.crystal-hospitality.com

Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai — 400026.
Adit Parikh

adtmprkh@gmail.com

+91-9930907674

GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP

On Tue, 17 Dec 2024 at 10:42, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel @k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Partners,

Kindly share the below Item Qtn

Delivery location — Chennai airport

| s.No | HSN CODE PARTICULARS | cLR | Q1Y |

2



1 84818020

ALD-CHR-563 - Health Faucet

Chr

50

Thanks & Regards

Heramb

9702415737




