Herambraj Sonawane

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, November 8, 2024 12:33 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane

Cc: Herambraj Sonawane; Shashikant Vishwakarma
Subject: Re: ELECTRICAL CONSUMABLE SPARES

Sir

Please check below the rate against your inquiry

Sr
No | Item name RATE
430/-
per +
1 EMERGENCY LIGHT 2FT Gst
150/-
per +
2 | SWITCH ROMA 16AMP Gst
120/-
per
mtr +
3 | WIRE SLEEVE 2.5MM Gst
68/-
THREE PIN TOP ANCHOR per +
4 16AMP Gst
235/-
LED TUBE 20 WATT 4FT per +
5 | WIPRO Gst




221/-
LE GRAND 6 MODULE per +
6 | PLATE Gst
287I-
per +

7 | 3 PIN SOKET 16AMP Gst
Need
Photo
and

8 | HANDING LIGHTS Details
76/-
per
3CORE 1.5 MM FLEXIBLE mtr +
9 | POLY CAB CABLE Gst
Delivery : 2-3 Working Days from Receipt of Payment
Payment 10% ADvance

Delivery Included

Best Wishes,

M. A. Electrical Solutions

6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai — 400007.
Meghal Parikh

meghalparikh1969@gmail.com

+91-9930211622

Crystal Hospitality

info@crystal-hospitality.com

www.crystal-hospitality.com

Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai — 400026.
Adit Parikh

adtmprkh@gmail.com

+91-9930907674

GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP




On Mon, 4 Nov 2024 at 17:28, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel(@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Partner

Kindly find below Detail and provide quote please .

Sr
No | Item name Qty
1 EMERGENCY LIGHT 2FT 4
2 SWITCH ROMA 16AMP 2
3 WIRE SLEEVE 2.5MM 20
4 THREE PIN TOP ANCHOR 16AMP | 1
5 LED TUBE 20 WATT 12
6 LE GRAND 6 MODULE PLATE 5
7 3 PIN SOKET 16AMP 2
8 HANDING LIGHTS 20
3CORE 1.5 MM FLEXIBLE POLY
9 CAB CABLE 30

Delivery location - CATERING COLLECTIVE -Mumbai-JK Banquets

Thanks & Regards

Heramb



9702415737



