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Herambraj Sonawane

From: Prima Enterprise <theprimaenterprise@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, April 12, 2024 1:52 PM
To: Herambraj Sonawane
Cc: Herambraj Sonawane; Lovejot Sekhon
Subject: Re: 32 Inch Smart FHD Monitor

Dear Sir ,  
 
REMINDER  
Demo unit box pack was given on 8th Feb . Demo was successful as well.As demo was done by Samsung team in your office. 
 
Awaiting the purchase order . Kindly let me know the status of the same . 
 
With Gratitude, 
Prashant Reelkar 
Tech IT Prima Solutions LLP  
9920334444 
 
On Fri, 5 Apr 2024 at 09:45, Prima Enterprise <theprimaenterprise@gmail.com> wrote: 
Dear Sir ,  
 
Demo unit box pack was given on 8th Feb . Demo was successful as well.As demo was done by Samsung team in your office. 
 
Awaiting the purchase order . Kindly let me know the status of the same . 
With Gratitude, 
Prashant Reelkar 
Tech IT Prima Solutions LLP  
9920334444 
 
 
On Thu, 21 Mar 2024 at 14:28, Prima Enterprise <theprimaenterprise@gmail.com> wrote: 
Resending .kindly share the PO . 
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Regards,  
Prashant R  
9920334444  
 

On Sat, 17 Feb 2024, 12:00 Prima Enterprise, <theprimaenterprise@gmail.com> wrote: 
Dear Sir ,  
 
As discussed , Please find below the pricing for  
 
S27CM501 white - INR 19,750 all inclusive .  
Basic Price : INR 16,737.28 / -  
 
With Gratitude, 
Prashant Reelkar 
Tech IT Prima Solutions LLP  
9920334444 
 
 
On Tue, 6 Feb 2024 at 19:15, Prima Enterprise <theprimaenterprise@gmail.com> wrote: 
Dear Sir , 
 
Please find below the price for Samsung Monitors . 
 
s32cm500 @21,000 all inclusive 
 
32 fhd smart 
 
 
With Gratitude, 
Prashant Reelkar 
Tech IT Prima Solutions LLP . 
9920334444  
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On Tue, 6 Feb 2024, 18:18 Herambraj Sonawane, <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Partner 

  

Kindly find below detail and provide Quote please  

  

Delivery location- TFS HO- shivsagar estate Mumbai 7th floor  

  

32 Inch Smart FHD Monitor with Stand 

Connectivity- Wireless Display | HDMI | Bluetooth & AV 

  

Total Quantity – 10 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 

Heramb 

  

9702415737 

  

  


