Swapnil Sutar

From: THE HOSPITALITY SOLUTION <thehospitalitysolution@gmail.com>
Sent: 15 June 2024 14:45

To: Swapnil Sutar

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Abdul Rehman

Subject: Re: Need quote - TFSPL-2425-00270

Dear Swapnil,
As per the details of the MerryChef high speed cooking oven spare parts provided by your. Here we
are sharing our quote for the same.

1) Original Merrychef P30Z1472 Magnetron, Toshiba 2M248E-B Rs. 34,800.00

2) Original Merrychef 3021586 Micro Switch, Short Actuator Arm, S36-232 Rs. 3,800.00

3) Original Merrychef 3224080 Cooking Basket, Solid, 11 X 11, E2S Rs. 27,400.00
4) GST@18% extra.

kindly go through the above quote and let us know your valuable feedback.
Assuring you of our best services at all times.



M/s. The Hospitality Solution.
Thanks & Regards

A. Khan
(Sr. Service Eng)

NOTE:

1) 100% ADVANCE PAYMENT.

i1) PAYMENT SHOULD BE ON THE NAME OF M/s. THE HOSPITALITY SOLUTION.

1i1) DELIVERY TIME 15-20 WORKING DAYS AFTER PO AND ADVANCE PAYMENT.

iv) THE ABOVE QUOTE IS ONLY FOR SUPPLY NO FIXING CHARGES INCLUDED IN IT.

v) THE ABOVE QUOTE IS GIVEN AS PER THE LIST OF SPARE PARTS AND PART NUMBERS PROVIDED BY YOU.

On Sat, Jun 15, 2024 at 10:56 AM Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar(@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Partner,

Please share the quote..

1) Magnetron - Part No:-P30Z1472
2) MICROSWITCH SHORT ARM Part No:-30Z1586
3) Cleaning liquid

4) Mesh basket Part No-30Z4080

Thanks & Regards,



Swapnil Sutar
H| & +919987022136

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

M/s.THE HOSPITALITY SOLUTION.

204 ,6alaxy Avenue, Nr.Cosmos Bldg,
Marol Maroshi Road, Marol,
Andheri(e), Mumbai-400 059.

Mobile - 09819104761.



