Herambraj Sonawane

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, November 18, 2024 11:47 AM

To: Herambraj Sonawane

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma

Subject: Re: New lights for Patio

Slr

Please check below the rate against your inquiry

1) Wall Grazer 36W IP66 --- 26 nos
Rate : 8135/- per + Gst

Terms and Conditions

Payment 100% Advance against thePO
Delivery : 4 weeks from receipt of Advance
Transportation Included

Best Wishes,

M. A. Electrical Solutions

6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai — 400007.

Meghal Parikh

meghalparikh1969@gamail.com

+91-9930211622

Crystal Hospitality

info@crystal-hospitality.com

www.crystal-hospitality.com

Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai — 400026.
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Adit Parikh
adtmprkh@gmail.com
+91-9930907674

GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP

On Fri, 15 Nov 2024 at 18:29, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel @Xk-corp.in> wrote:

Please check the light specs and provide a rate

Thanks & Regards

Heramb

9702415737



