Herambraj Sonawane

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Sir,

Prima Enterprise <theprimaenterprise@gmail.com>
Saturday, June 10, 2023 1:16 PM

Herambraj Sonawane

Kamal Saraf; Lovejot Sekhon

Re: Locker and cash counting machine - PAN India

Please find below the pricing which is inclusive of Freight.

Item description

Quantity|mrp All incl (INR)

Base price (INR)

Godrej Locker 40 ltr digi Ivory 100 21399

19500

16525

Godrej Crusader Lite Cash Counting machine 100 25023

17000

14407

Note : All inclusive price of Freight PAN India

With Gratitude,

Account Management Team

Prima Enterprise
9920334444

On Fri, 9 Jun 2023 at 23:32, Prima Enterprise <theprimaenterprise@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir ,

Please find below the catalogue.

To share the pricing along with the freight would need the list of places and count.As the weight of
counting machine is 7-8 kg and locker is 18-20kgs.

Will share the pricing soon.

40L
Digital

Sizec (cmj: 42(h) x 35w x 35(d)

{mm): 420(h) x 3500w x 350(d)

Weight: 16Kg,  Volurme: 40L1r
*Compatible with I-Buzz Alarm
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With Gratitude,
Account Management Team

Prima Enterprise
9920334444

On Fri, 9 Jun 2023 at 16:16, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Partner

Kindly find below detail and provide Quote for the same

Item description Quantity




Godrej Locker 40 ltr digi Ivory 100
Godrej Crusader Lite Cash Counting
machine 100

Delivery pan India — Freight inclusive

Thanks & Regards

Heramb

9702415737




