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Herambraj Sonawane

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 18, 2024 7:30 PM
To: Herambraj Sonawane
Cc: Herambraj Sonawane
Subject: Re: electrical Consumables to all terminals.

Sir 
 
Please check below the rate against your inquiry 
 

ITEM NAME RATE 

15A Limit Switch REPON Make 

120/- 
per + 

GST20 

19-25A MPCB L&T Make 

4200/- 
per + 
Gst 2 

 
Best Wishes, 
M. A. Electrical Solutions 
6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai – 400007. 
Meghal Parikh 
meghalparikh1969@gmail.com 
+91-9930211622 
Crystal Hospitality 
info@crystal-hospitality.com 
www.crystal-hospitality.com 
Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai – 400026. 
Adit Parikh 
adtmprkh@gmail.com 
+91-9930907674 
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GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP 
 
 
On Wed, 18 Sept 2024 at 15:59, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear sir 

  

Please provide Rate for this two item also 

  

ITEM NAME QTY 
15A Limit Switch REPON Make 20 
19-25A MPCB L&T Make 2 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 

Heramb 

  

9702415737 

  

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 18, 2024 3:51 PM 
To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: electrical Consumables to all terminals. 
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Sir 

  

Please take this as confirmation of the rates. 

  

Transportation AT Actual 

Payment 100% Advance with GST 

  

Best Wishes, 

M. A. Electrical Solutions 

6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai – 400007. 

Meghal Parikh 

meghalparikh1969@gmail.com 

+91-9930211622 

Crystal Hospitality 

info@crystal-hospitality.com 

www.crystal-hospitality.com 

Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai – 400026. 
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Adit Parikh 

adtmprkh@gmail.com 

+91-9930907674 

GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP 

  

  

On Wed, 18 Sept 2024 at 15:37, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi Meghal 

  

Please provide confirmation on below price . 

  

  

sr 
no 

item name QTY Rate 

1 SM 500 Single Phase Preventer GIG Make 5 1300 
2 2 KW Heating Element NIMBUS Make 15 650 
3 3 KW Heating Element NIMBUS Make 15 790 

4 
6M PVC Box 10 Nos for all terminal 
consumables 

10 
110 

5 3M PVC Box LEGRAND Make 10 70 

6 
16A Switch 20 Nos for all terminal 
consumables. 

20 
130 

7 
16A Socket 20 Nos for all terminal 
consumables. 

20 190 
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Thanks & Regards 

Heramb 

  

9702415737 

  

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, September 16, 2024 3:56 PM 
To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com> 
Subject: Re: electrical Consumables to all terminals. 

  

Sir 

  

Please check below the rate against your inquiry 

  

sr no item name RATE 

1 
SM 500 Single Phase Preventer GIG 
Make 

1750/- per + 
Gst ( GIC 
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MG73BH, 
SM500-

3PH/1PH, 4W 
Single 

Phasing 
Preventor, 

Selectable ON 
Delay 0 to 15 

Sec & OFF 
Delay 5 Sec 

) ) 

2 
2 KW Heating Element NIMBUS 
Make 

770/- per + 
Gst 

3 
3 KW Heating Element NIMBUS 
Make 

840/- per + 
Gst 

4 
6M PVC Box 10 Nos for all terminal 
consumables 

135/- per + 
Gst 

5 3M PVC Box LEGRAND Make 89/- per + Gst 

6 
16A Switch 20 Nos for all terminal 
consumables. 

165/- per + 
Gst 

7 
16A Socket 20 Nos for all terminal 
consumables. 

248/- per + 
Gst 

  

TERMS & CONDITIONS 

1) Transportation Included 

2) Payment 100% Advance with GST 

3) GST Extra As Applicable 
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4) Delivery : 5-6 Days from Receipt of Payment 

  

  

Best Wishes, 

M. A. Electrical Solutions 

6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai – 400007. 

Meghal Parikh 

meghalparikh1969@gmail.com 

+91-9930211622 

Crystal Hospitality 

info@crystal-hospitality.com 

www.crystal-hospitality.com 

Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai – 400026. 

Adit Parikh 

adtmprkh@gmail.com 

+91-9930907674 

GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP 
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On Mon, 16 Sept 2024 at 14:19, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Reminder 

  

Please provide quote . 

  

Thanks & Regards 

Heramb 

  

9702415737 

  

From: Herambraj Sonawane  
Sent: Tuesday, September 10, 2024 7:55 PM 
To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com> 
Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in> 
Subject: electrical Consumables to all terminals. 

  

Dear Partner 

  

Kindly find below detail and provide Quote please . 

  

sr no item name QTY 



9

1 SM 500 Single Phase Preventer GIG Make 5 
2 2 KW Heating Element NIMBUS Make 15 
3 3 KW Heating Element NIMBUS Make 15 

4 
6M PVC Box 10 Nos for all terminal 
consumables 10 

5 3M PVC Box LEGRAND Make 10 

6 
16A Switch 20 Nos for all terminal 
consumables. 20 

7 
16A Socket 20 Nos for all terminal 
consumables. 20 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 

Heramb 

  

9702415737 

  


