Mrunal Joshi

From: Pioneer Project Solution <projectspioneer@gmail.com>
Sent: 23 October 2024 17:16

To: Mrunal Joshi

Cc: Stephen P; Pushpak Shewale; Sarvesh Patil

Subject: Re: Starter Panel with VFD- Delhi T1 BOH

Please Proceed 30000 plus Tax
Thanks

On Wed, 23 Oct 2024, 17:13 Mrunal Joshi, <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi Ashrafji,

Kindly provide quotations for starter panel as discussed to proceed further with the order.

Regards,

Mrunal.



