
SNo Item Code HSN\SAC Code Item Description UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise

Total Tax 
Amount
(ININR)

Total Amount
(ININR)

1 FA018892 39199090 BARRICADING WORK FOR THIRD WAVE 
COFFEE

110.00 616 18.00 0.00 0 67760.00

2 401132 Invoice Rounding 0.20 1 0.00 0.00 0 0.20
Total Unit 617.00 Total Taxable INR 67,760.20

Excise Amount 0.00
SGST Amount 6,098.40
SGST Amount 6,098.40

c) Delivery schedule to be taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST 
INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE DELIVERY 
ADDRESS.

Charges Amount 0.00

e) The Payment of taxes will be Released once the Taxes is 
Credited to our Account or the GST Portal

Total INR Incl. Taxes 79,956.80

Terms:-
Payment Terms - 50% advance and balance 50% after successfull work 
completion 

and invoice submission

Mobilisation - 27 November 2024

Work Completion - 30 November ost receipt of cdr files on 26th November

Outlet name - Third Wave Cafe Delhi T3

Page No: 1

Vendor No. V02749 Purchase Order
Order Number PWO/11/24-25/100002

Page No: 125-11-2024  13:54:02VIKAT VINAYAK18 SERVICE PRIVATE LIMITEDB-56-A S/F Back Side Block B Matiala ExtnUttam Nagar, West Delhi, Delhi, Delhi, IndiaNEW DELHI, 110059India
Shipped Location
Travel Food Services (Delhi Terminal 3) Pvt. LtdNew Udaan Bhawan , ND - 110037NEW DELHI, 110037India

Invoice LocationTravel Food Services (Delhi Terminal 3) Pvt. LtdNew Udaan Bhawan , ND - 110037110037IN

Travel Food Services (Delhi Terminal 3) Pvt. LtdNew Udaan BhawanT 3,IGI Airport110037 NEW DELHIP.A.N. No. AAHCV8233E
Contact PersonContact No.
PO Entry DatePayment Terms 25-11-2024

Corporate Address

State Name NEWDELHIComp GST No. 07AADCT3703B1ZW
State 07

State Code 07State Name NEWDELHIVendor GST No. 07AAHCV8233E1Z9Vendor Inv. No.
Vendor Phone No. 9871323798
Dept. NameVendor Email INFOVIKATVINAYAK18@GMAIL.COM

Not Approved

Indent NoHO PO No.HO PO DateWeb : www.travelfoodservices.com C.I.N : U55101DL2009PTC196639



Item Code Item Name UOM Qty Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1

Barricading work with proper wooden support finished with ply 10 mm and 
flex printed with Dominos front 3 d view. Art work to be approved before 

installation - REMOVER AND DISCARD BARRICADE POST 
COMPLETION - 56 ft X 11 Ft

SQFT 616 110 67760 185 113960

67760 113960

Vikat vinayak RUDRA INTERIORS



 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

    

 

                                   PROFORMA INVOICE 
VIKAT VINAYAK18 SERVICES PVT LTD 
B-56-A Matiala Extn Near Govt. School Delhi-110059 
GSTIN: 07AAHCV8233E1Z9 

Travel Food Services (Delhi Terminal 3) Pvt Ltd 
New Udaan Bhawan 
T3 IGI Airport Delhi 110037 
GSTIN: 07AADCT3703B1ZW 

Description of Services Sq. ft.  Rate Amount 

 
BARRICADING WORK AS PER DIAL 
GUIDELINES PROVIDING BARRICADE WITH 
8X4, 12 MMPLYWOOD AND BATTON FINISH 
WITH DIAL APPROVED ART WORK 

   

 
 
                  616 

 
 
        110 

 
 
      67,760 

Total       67,760 

GST: 9%       6098.4 

SGST: 9%          6098.4 

IGST:18% ---- 

Grand Total         79,956.8 
INR Seventy Nine Thousand Nine Hundred Fifty Six Only 

 
Bank Details: Bank Name: - SBI, Branch: - RAJAPURI DELHI, IFSC Code: - SBIN0061213, Account No.: - 
39971023162 

Terms & Conditions:  

 

1. Work will complete One days 
2. Work will be started after receiving 100% advance. 
3. Interest will be charged @ 18% per annum if the full 

amount of the Invoice is not paid within Two weeks of 
its date. 

4. All disputes are subject to Delhi Jurisdiction. 
 



1

Abdul Rehman

From: VIKAT VINAYAK <infovikatvinayak18@gmail.com>
Sent: 22 November 2024 16:33
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Anil Kushwaha; Shadab Sukri; Binu Balachandran; Smrutika Thoti
Subject: Re: Delhi T3 3rd wave cafe Barricading Work
Attachments: TFS.pdf

Dear Sir 
 
Please See PI for barricade work as per Airport Guidelines  
 
 

Best Regards 

Jitendra Tiwari 

Business Head  

For VIKAT VINAYAK18 SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED 

M: +91 9871323798 
Email ID: infovikatvinayak18@gmail.com 
Website: www.vikatvinayak18.com 
 
 
On Fri, Nov 22, 2024 at 3:20 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Partners,  

  

Request you to kindly share the quote for below mentioned work at 3rd wave Delhi T3.  

  

Barricading work for Third Wave Coffee T3    
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Item Code Item Name UOM Qty 
Unit 
Price 

1 

Barricading work with proper wooden support finished with ply 10 
mm and flex printed with Dominos front 3 d view. Art work to be 
approved before installation - REMOVER AND DISCARD 
BARRICADE POST COMPLETION       

a 56 ft X 11 Ft SQFT 616   

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
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Abdul Rehman

From: Project Rudras <project@rudrasip.com>
Sent: 25 November 2024 12:49
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Anil Kushwaha; Shadab Sukri; Binu Balachandran; Smrutika Thoti
Subject: Estimate for Delhi T3 3rd wave cafe Barricading Work
Attachments: Estimates-T3 Third wave cafe.pdf

 
Dear Sir, 
 
Please find the attached file of estimates for barricading work  at T3 Third wave Cafe. 
 
 
Regards 
Sharad Sharma 
Rudras Interior Point Pvt. Ltd. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Manoj Jangid <manoj@rudrasip.com> 
Date: Mon, Nov 25, 2024 at 12:13 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Delhi T3 3rd wave cafe Barricading Work 
To: Project Rudras <project@rudrasip.com> 
 

 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Date: Fri, 22 Nov 2024 at 15:20 
Subject: Delhi T3 3rd wave cafe Barricading Work 
To:  



2

Cc: Anil Kushwaha <Delhi.receivables@travelfoodservices.com>, Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>, Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>, Smrutika Thoti 
<smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com> 
 

Dear Partners,  

  

Request you to kindly share the quote for below mentioned work at 3rd wave Delhi T3.  

  

Barricading work for Third Wave Coffee T3    

Item Code Item Name UOM Qty 
Unit 
Price 

1 

Barricading work with proper wooden support finished with ply 10 
mm and flex printed with Dominos front 3 d view. Art work to be 
approved before installation - REMOVER AND DISCARD 
BARRICADE POST COMPLETION       

a 56 ft X 11 Ft SQFT 616   

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  


