Swapnil Sutar

From: nietco . <nietco@hotmail.com>
Sent: 08 February 2024 13:09
To: Swapnil Sutar
Cc: Abdul Rehman; Sandeep Bhat
Subject: Re: Need quote - PULVERIZER- TFSPL-2324-00245
Attachments: LINCON Pulveriser catalog.pdf
Dear Sir,

Greetings from New India Trading Co !!
Thank you for your valuable enquiry.
Please find details as required:

1 LINCON Pulveriser
LP30, 3 Hp, 1 Phase, 2900 Rpm Rs. 39,500/- each

TERMS & CONDITIONS :

GST : 18% extra

Packing & Freight : Extra as applicable

PRICE : Ex- showroom Mumbai

Lead Time : 1 week

PAYMENT : 100% ADVANCE.

Installation : Extra

Inland Freight from Mumbai to Client's site : Extra

WARRANTY : SIX MONTHS ON MOTOR FROM THE DATE OF COMMERCIAL INVOICE.
VALIDITY : QUOTE VALID FOR 15 DAYS THERE AFTER SUBJECT TO OUR CONFIRMATION.

Thanking you,
Warm regards,




Prakash Vaswani

New India Trading Co.,

38 Ambalal Doshi Marg,
Hamam House, Nr. BSE,
Fort, Mumbai — 400 023.
tel: + 22 - 2265 1177

tel fax: + 22 - 2265 1597
E-mail:nietco@hotmail.com
www.pastamachine.in

From: Swapnil Sutar< >

Sent: Wednesday, February 7, 2024 18:36

Cc: Abdul Rehman < >

Subject: Need quote - PULVERIZER- TFSPL-2324-00245

Dear Partner,

Please quote for below.

PULVERIZER LP 30 1PH

PULVERIZER JALI SET

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
H | & +919987022136
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



