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Swapnil Sutar

From: Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>
Sent: 02 January 2025 17:38
To: Dheeraj Yadav; Swapnil Sutar
Cc: Zafar Hashmi; sunil.sharma@k-corp.com; Sunil Kumar Sharma; Zafar Hashmi (PCS Courier); Manish Kumar-New; Lovejot Sekhon
Subject: Re: Eklara to Una & Manesar to Una _ 8ft Pickup

Dear Sir  
Kindly refer the last discussion with Mr. Zafar and Mr. Swapnil, The Final cost will be Rs 41,000/- + GST  
Kindly share the PO and release advance.  
 
 
Regards, 

Pradnya  
--- 

 
--- 
Email :   pcs.courier@gmail.com 
 
 
 
 
On Fri, Dec 27, 2024 at 7:24 PM Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 
Hi Swapnil, 
 
Kindly have it closed without further delay.  
 
Thanks and regards  
 
Dheeraj  
 
Sent from Android device 
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On 27 Dec 2024 18:52, Zafar Hashmi <zafarhashmi74@gmail.com> wrote: 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Mr. Dheeraj / Mr. Swapnil  
Kindly find a new (revised) Cost for 14 ft Truck from Eklara to UNA via Manesar  
The cost will be Rs. 49,999/- + GST @5%  
 
Regards 
--- 

Zafar Hashmi 

Mumbai, India 
Cell    : +91-8976076545   |  +91 9082661835 
Email : Zafarhashmi74@gmail.com   
 

 

 
 
On Fri, 27 Dec 2024 at 12:54, Zafar Hashmi <zafarhashmi74@gmail.com> wrote: 
Dear Mr. Dheeraj / Mr Swapnil 
Hoping this email finds you well. 
Earlier it was 2 vehicles of 8 ft. 1 vehicle of 8ft from Eklara to Una and the 2nd vehicle from Manesar to Una.  
The rate was given for the same you can find out in the trail mail.  
Now there are 2 options and I am sharing you the both rates.  
 

1. Eklara to Una - 8 Ft ---- Freight 41,000/- + Gst @5%  + Manesar to Una 8ft --- Rs  14500 + 5% GST = Total Rs 55,500/- + GST  
2. Eklara to UNA via Manesar 14FT --- 53,000 + 5% GST 

Insurance Extra Rs 1181/- (Per Invoice / Per Location) + Gst  
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Regards 
--- 

Zafar Hashmi 

Mumbai, India 
Cell    : +91-8976076545   |  +91 9082661835 
Email : Zafarhashmi74@gmail.com   
 

 

 
 
On Thu, 26 Dec 2024 at 21:21, Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 
We don't understand the reason of asking for invoice or value of equipment when we have asked for a 14 feet long vehicle for the shifting of these 
equipment at two different locations.  
 
Kindly share the quotation at earliest.  
 
Thanks  
 
Dheeraj  
 
Sent from Android device 
 
On 26 Dec 2024 20:32, Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> wrote: 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Mr. Swapnil  
Kindly share the Invoice or at least share the Material value to raise the PI.  
 
 
Regards, 

Pradnya  
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--- 

 
--- 
Email :   pcs.courier@gmail.com 
 
 
 
 
On Wed, Dec 11, 2024 at 5:16 PM Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Zafar Bhai, 

Please share the revised rates… 

  

Thanks & Regards, 

  

Swapnil Sutar 

📱 | ☎  +91 9987022136 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 10 December 2024 14:01 
To: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> 
Subject: FW: Eklara to Una & Manesar to Una _ 8ft Pickup 
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FYR… 

  

  

  

Thanks and Regards 

  

Dheeraj Yadav 

Senior Manager Projects 

  

Travel Food Services  

Business Plus, 

12th Floor, Tower-A, 

Vatika Mindscapes, 

NH-2, Mathura Road, 

Sector-27D, Faridabad, 

Haryana - 121003 

8920837882 
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From: Zafar Hashmi <zafarhashmi74@gmail.com>  
Sent: 15 November 2024 10:54 PM 
To: Sunil Kumar Sharma <sunil.sharma@travelfoodservices.com>; sunil.sharma@k-corp.com 
Cc: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Kumar-New <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>; Zafar 
Hashmi (PCS Courier) <zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in> 
Subject: Eklara to Una & Manesar to Una _ 8ft Pickup 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Mr. Sunil  

1. Kalaghat to Una 

    

 Dedicated 8 ft (Eklara to Una ) Kalaghat to UNA   

 Particular  Cost   

 Freight (8-FTL) 39,500.00  

 Docket / LR Charge ( Per Shipment / Per Invoice) 50.00  

 Loading & Unloading  Not in Our scope  

 

Insurance Per Invoice (for the invoice value of Rs. 5,00,000/-) 
OPTIONAL 1,181.00  

 Delivery Schedule 2-3 Days  
    

+ 
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FOV @0.2% 

FSC @10% 

GST @5% 

  

  

  

2. Kalaghat to Una 

    

 Dedicated 8 ft (Manesar to Una ) Manesar  to UNA   

 Particular  Cost   

 Freight (8-FTL) 13,500.00  

 Docket / LR Charge ( Per Shipment / Per Invoice) 50.00  

 Loading & Unloading  Not in Our scope  

 

Insurance Per Invoice (for the invoice value of Rs. 5,00,000/-) 
OPTIONAL 1,181.00  

 Delivery Schedule 1-2 days  
    

+ 

FOV @0.2% 

FSC @10% 

GST @5% 
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Warm Regards 

---- 

Zafar Hashmi 

Mumbai, India 
Cell    : +91-8976076545   |   +91-9082661835 

Email : Zafarhashmi74@gmail.com   

  

  


