Abdul Rehman

From: onkar_aggarwal@rediffmail.com on behalf of ONKAR AGGARWAL <onkar_aggarwal@rediffmail.com>
Sent: 27 March 2024 17:43

To: Abdul Rehman

Subject: Re: Una Ms Racks Requirement

rack rate 3900 rs/-
fixing charges 4000/-
cartage 4000/-

GST 18% EXTRA
ANGLE 14G

SHELF 18G

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>
Sent: Tue, 26 Mar 2024 21:58:32

To: <recipients undisclosed>

Subject: Una Ms Racks Requirement

Dear Partners

Please quote for below for our upcoming outlet of Bikanerwala in Una

Outlet Name|S. No. Equipment Dimensions Qty

Bikanervala |BK-09|MS POWDER COATED RACK WITH 8 SHELVES (915Wx450Dx1950H)|(915Wx450Dx1950H) (12

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

| & +91 9920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



