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Abdul Rehman

From: PODDAR TRANSPORT <poddartransport@gmail.com>
Sent: 01 March 2024 11:22
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar
Subject: Re: Delhhi To Mumbai T1

Booking confirmed.  
 
On Fri, Mar 1, 2024 at 11:11 AM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

HI Piyush Ji,  

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: PODDAR TRANSPORT <poddartransport@gmail.com>  
Sent: 01 March 2024 10:49 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: Delhhi To Mumbai T1 

  

PODDAR TRANSPORT 

As discussed with you on call we are ok with the revised initiated cost of RS 45000 for 22 feet container. Please align the vehicle tomorrow for pickup.  
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TRANSPORT CONTRACTORS & FLEET OWNERS 
 H-3/203, Vardhaman Tower Plaza, NSP, New Delhi 

Phone: 8700192561, 9311102001 
www.poddartransport.com 

Kind Attn : Mr Abdul ji 

  

With reference to Trailing Email, please note that we are herewith happy to quote our most competitive Freight-Rate for the transportation of your Consignments, based on the details provided by your good-selves 
as below: 

  

                                                  

                                                         

GST Extra / Reverse Basis                                                                                                 

  

Bilty Charges Rs 100/-  

GST payable by recipient of services of GTA on Reverse Charge Basis  

Vehicle Halting /Detained Rs 2,500/- per day  

  

We request you that you kindly consider our above Freight-Quote & confirm the same in all respects by your 'PURCHASE-Order' Copy or per return mail, and thereby give us an opportunity to serve you. 

  

Your early & positive response will be highly appreciated. 

  

On Thu, Feb 29, 2024 at 3:11 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Ex Manesar to Mumbai Airport                          Rs 45,000/- for 22 ft Container  
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Hi,  

  

We need 24 ft FTL vehicle to pickup fabrication material from Delhi to Mumbai T1 Airport. Request you to kindly share the cost at the earliest.  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

 
 

  

--  

thanking you,  

regards. 

  

Delhi Team 
PODDAR TRANSPORT  

  

Corp. office -  H-3/203, Vardhaman Plaza Tower, Netaji Subhash Place,New Delhi-110034 
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Regd. office - 2053-54 , Chuna Mandi,Street-6, Paharganj. New Delhi -110055 

  

9311102001, 8700192561 

9810029460  

011-23585096 

| Go Green | The future will thank you 

NOW APPROVED - Food Safety and Standards Authority of India 

Save a tree. Don't print this e-mail unless it's really necessary 
 

Disclaimer: "All Disclaimer Clauses as applicable to electronic communications, under all the relevant Acts, are applicable to the contents of this email and its attachments" 

CLICK HERE TO VISIT OUR WEBSITE /BRANCH LOCATOR/ TESTIMONIALS  

CLICK HERE TO LIKE US ON FACEBOOK 
 

 
 
 
--  
thanking you,  
regards. 
 
Delhi Team 
PODDAR TRANSPORT  
 
Corp. office -  H-3/203, Vardhaman Plaza Tower, Netaji Subhash Place,New Delhi-110034 
 
Regd. office - 2053-54 , Chuna Mandi,Street-6, Paharganj. New Delhi -110055 
 
9311102001, 8700192561 
9810029460  
011-23585096 
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| Go Green | The future will thank you 
NOW APPROVED - Food Safety and Standards Authority of India 

Save a tree. Don't print this e-mail unless it's really necessary 
 

Disclaimer: "All Disclaimer Clauses as applicable to electronic communications, under all the relevant Acts, are applicable to the contents of this email and its attachments" 
CLICK HERE TO VISIT OUR WEBSITE /BRANCH LOCATOR/ TESTIMONIALS  
CLICK HERE TO LIKE US ON FACEBOOK 
 


