
MITTAL INTERNATIONAL 
7,  Netaji Subhash Marg, Darya Ganj New Delhi – 110 002 

Phones :   011- 23242500/01/02/03, 35008050/51 

E-mail : sales@mitalin.com  Web : www.mitalin.com 

Date : - 24-11-2023                                Mitalinternational.In     @Mitalint    

To, 

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PVT . LTD.        PI No.: MI/2023-24/573 

Third Wave Coffee 

Delhi T - 1 

Kind Attn. Mr. Sandeep Bhat ( 9821945599 ) 

 

Dear Sir, 

With reference to the discussion, we are pleased to give you Proforma Invoice as follows:-  

 

PROFORMA INVOICE 
ITEM MAKE  MODEL HS CODE QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

Rinse O Matic Vitamix Rinse O Matic 84199090 1 14,500.00 14,500.00 

Additional Jar Vitamix Jar 39269099 2 11,000.00 22,000.00 

Blender Vitamix The Quit One 84198120 1 95,000.00 95,000.00 

TOTAL 1,31,500.00 

Freight 1,500.00 

SUB TOTAL 1,33,000.00 

Add IGST @ 18%  23,940.00 

GRAND TOTAL 1,56,940.00 
 

TERMS & CONDITIONS:  
PAYMENT   : 100% ADVANCE. 
UNLOADING  : IN YOUR SCOPE. 
INSUARNCE   : 1% ( OUT OF DELHI ). 
WARRANTY  : ONE YEAR ON LABOUR & PARTS FROM THE DATE OF COMMERCIAL INVOICE. 
ORDER CANCEL  : IF ORDER CANCELS WE WILL CHARGE 20%+GST OF ORDER VALUE. 
 
OUR BANK DETAIL ARE AS UNDER 
STANDARD CHARTERED BANK 
PREET VIHAR, ADITYA ARCADE, ADITYA COMPLEX 
PLOT 30, COMMUNITY CENTRE PREET VIHAR, DELHI - 110092 
MITTAL INTERNATIONAL 
A/C NO: 53205071052 
IFSC CODE: SCBL0036023 

 
Regards 
Manoj Kumar 
Mob. :- 9312210731 
E-mail – manoj@mitalin.com 

http://www.mitalin.com/
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Swapnil Sutar

From: sales@mitalin.com
Sent: 24 November 2023 16:09
To: Sandeep Bhat
Cc: Swapnil Sutar; Abdul Rehman; Anil Sachdeva; Charan H M; Manoj Kumar
Subject: Re: 3rd Wave Cafe - Delhi T1 - Mittal International
Attachments: PI -573.pdf

Dear Sir, 
  
Please find attached proforma invoice for your reference. 
  
Regards 
Manoj Kumar 
Mob. :- 9312210731 
E-mail - manoj@mitalin.com 
 
Mittal International  
7, Netaji Subhash Marg, 
Darya Ganj, 
New Delhi - 110002 
Tel: 011- 23242500/01/02/03, 35008050/51 
e-mail : sales@mitalin.com 
website : www.mitalin.com 
  
From: Sandeep Bhat  
Sent: Saturday, November 18, 2023 12:26 PM 
To: sales@mitalin.com ; manoj@mitalin.com ; Anil Sachdeva  
Cc: Swapnil Sutar ; Abdul Rehman ; Anil Sachdeva ; Charan H M  
Subject: RE: 3rd Wave Cafe - Delhi T1 - Mittal International 
  
Dear Manoj , 
  
Extra Blender Jar Model No as follows  
VMO 127( 2lrs )  
  



2

  
  
Thanks & Regards  
Sandeep Bhat  
Senior Manager Purchase  
Travel foods Services Pvt Ltd 
Shivsagar Estate A-Block , 1st floor 
Dr A.B Road , Worli Mumbai -400018 
Mob : 9821945599 
  
  

From: Sandeep Bhat  
Sent: 18 November 2023 12:08 
To: sales@mitalin.com; manoj@mitalin.com; Anil Sachdeva <anil@mitalin.com> 
Cc: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Anil Sachdeva <anil@mitalin.com>; Charan H M 
<charan.hm@thirdwavecoffee.in> 
Subject: 3rd Wave Cafe - Delhi T1 - Mittal International 
  
Dear Manoj  
  
Requirement is for 3rd Wave Coffee ,  revised requirement is as follows ,  

 Vitamix Quite One 3HP with 2 EXTRA Jar 
 Rin somatic 

  
  
please share find delivery & billing details  

Travel Food services Pvt Ltd 

Indira Gandhi International airport 

Delhi Terminal 1 , New Delhi 

GST No : 07AADCB2762L2ZJ 
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From: sales@mitalin.com <sales@mitalin.com>  
Sent: 10 November 2023 18:13 
To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot 
Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shyam Krishna <shyam.krishna@thirdwavecoffee.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Anil Sachdeva <anil@mitalin.com> 
Subject: Re: 3rd Wave Cafe - Delhi T1 - Mittal International 
  
Dear Sir, 
  
Please find attached quotation for your reference. 
  
Regards 
Anil Sachdeva 
Mob. :- 9811817582 
E-mail - anil@mitalin.com 
 
Mittal International  
7, Netaji Subhash Marg, 
Darya Ganj, 
New Delhi - 110002 
Tel: 011- 23242500/01/02/03, 35008050/51 
e-mail : sales@mitalin.com 
website : www.mitalin.com 
  
From: Sandeep Bhat  
Sent: Friday, November 10, 2023 5:40 PM 
To: Abdul Rehman ; manoj@mitalin.com ; Anil ; sales@mitalin.com  
Cc: Swapnil Sutar ; Smrutika Thoti ; Shadab Sukri ; Lovejot Sekhon ; Shyam Krishna  
Subject: RE: 3rd Wave Cafe - Delhi T1 - Mittal International 
  
Dear Anil & team  
  
We are coming up with 3rd wave Café at Delhi T1 Airport. We request you to kindly provide us the Quotation. 
  
  



4

No. in 
Drawing ITEM QTY CAPACITY 

OVERALL 
SIZE 

4 
Dipper well Faucet & 
Sink. (Imported) 1 - 

140 Ø x 
280ht 

10 

Blender M/C 2 speed 
Extra jar Add on Jar for 
the blender  2 

-Vitamix 
/JTC 
Model No. 
TM-767A 

203 x 229 
x 440 

11 Sealing Machine 1 -  
19           Ice Capacity - 100 KG / Day  1            Scotsman 
  
  
  

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>  
Sent: 06 November 2023 20:24 
To: manoj@mitalin.com 
Cc: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Shadab Sukri 
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shyam Krishna <shyam.krishna@thirdwavecoffee.in> 
Subject: 3rd Wave Cafe - Delhi T1 - Mittal International 
  
Hi Manoj, 
  
We are coming up with 3rd wave Café at Delhi T1 Airport. We request you to kindly provide us the Quotation. 
  
No. in 
Drawing ITEM QTY CAPACITY 

OVERALL 
SIZE 

4 
Dipperwell Faucet 
& Sink. (Imported) 1 - 

140 Ø x 
280ht 

10 
Blender M/C 2 
speed 2 - 

203 x 229 x 
440 

11 Sealing Machine 1 -  
  


