Mrunal Joshi

From: Support Safal

Sent: 19 September 2024 18:37

To: Mrunal Joshi

Cc: Ali Holda; Snehal Rajpal; Vijay Sarkale; Binu Balachandran; Parag Pandey; Lovejot
Sekhon

Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Mrunal ji,

We regret to inform you that due to the complexity of logic and the potential for multiple unintended
consequences, we are unable to make any changes from backend.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 September 2024 18:17

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal <snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale
<vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Mrunal ji,
Noted. We will update you for the same.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 September 2024 17:42

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal <snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale
<vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Hi team Safal,

Please do the needful here.
Thanks.

Regards,
Mrunal.

From: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 September 2024 17:41

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal <snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale
<vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey
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<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Approved.

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: Thursday, September 19, 2024 1:58 PM

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Cc: Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal <snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale
<vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

@Lovejot sir, Request you to approve the below request to change the invoice and shipping location to CC bandra
new by replacing CCR City.

Regards,
Mrunal.

From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 September 2024 13:52

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal
<snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Binu Balachandran
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Mrunal ji,

Please get the approval from Lovejot ji if you want to change Shipping location and Invoice location in PO
print from backend.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 September 2024 13:44

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal
<snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Binu Balachandran
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Safal team,

PFA the fresh print of the same PO taken today.
Kindly check and help us correcting the invoice and shipping location to CC bandra new.

Regards,
Mrunal.



From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 September 2024 13:41

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal
<snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Binu Balachandran
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Mrunal ji,

PO - DCPL/P0O/24-25/000149 was created on 29-08-2024 and this is the old print which was taken on 29-
08-2024.

But GST for Branch CC R City was changed on 31-08-204.
So, please take a fresh print of PO and inform us if still you are having any issue.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 September 2024 12:54

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal
<snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Binu Balachandran
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Mrunal ji,
We are checking the issue, we will update you for the same.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 September 2024 11:54

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal
<snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Safal team,

PFA the PO for Copper Chimney Bandra in which the address is mentioned for Ghatkopar instead of Bandra.
Request you to look into this and suggest a solution urgently.
Thanks.

Regards,
Mrunal.

From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 31 August 2024 14:16

To: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>
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Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>; Snehal Rajpal
<snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>
Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Parag ji,

As discussed on call GST number of branch CC R City and CC Bandra New has been changed to
27AAACD1685R1Z3. @Mrunal Joshi please check it.

Please find attached branch master and entity master export as requested.

FYL

Branch CC R City was created by user MASTERCREATION.TFS
(mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com) on 2024-04-03 17:44:29.297

Branch CC Bandra New was created by user ISHAN.SURTANI (ishan.surtani@kapcocatering.com) on
2024-04-03 17:43:37.710

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 31 August 2024 12:07

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Snehal Rajpal
<snehal.rajpal@safalsoftcom.com>; Ali Holda <ali.holda@safalsoftcom.com>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Hi Snehal,

Please get in to this. Under Invoice location GST of supplier is coming and Bhagyesh need your help to understand
the same.

| require proper response on this to know the matter in detail
@ Ali- FYI

Regards,
Parag Pandey

From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 31 August 2024 11:40

To: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Cc: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha <ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari
<amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Prashant Gaikwad <statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit
<manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Parag ji,

For Deluxe Caterers Pvt. Ltd. Entity GST number 27AAACD1685R1Z3 is already updated correctly.



@Mrunal Joshi is asking for your approval to change GST number of Branch CC Bandra New and CC R
City as same as Deluxe Caterers Pvt. Ltd. Entity.

@Mrunal Joshi please elaborate this from your side to Parag ji and get the approval.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 31 August 2024 11:05

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha <ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari
<amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Prashant Gaikwad <statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit
<manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Approved.

@ Safal team- Please update below GST number in master of company “Deluxe Caterers Pvt Ltd” correct it urgently
to avoid wrong communication on PO’s

GSTIN Trade Name Legal Name Address State Pincode Type Status Is
SEZ
27AAACD1685R1Z3 DELUXE DELUXE 12-A ,GR MAHARASHTRA 400018 Regular ACT No
CATERERS CATERERS Floor , Worli
PVT.LTD. PVT.LTD.
Regards,

Parag Pandey

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: 29 August 2024 17:39

To: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha <ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari
<amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Prashant Gaikwad <statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit
<manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Gentle Reminder..

Regards,
Mrunal.

From: Mrunal Joshi

Sent: 26 August 2024 09:52

To: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha <ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari
<amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Sachin Tirlotkar <statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit
<manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Support Safal
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<support.safal@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Parag Sir,

Please approve the below trail mail request to correct the GST number in the masters for CC bandra & CC R City
branches.

Invoice Location Corporate Address

CC Bandra New Deluxe Caterers Pvt. Ltd.

266, Linking Road, Bandra, Mumbai Lotus Court Ground Floor Door No
400050 12A, Dr. Annie Besant Road, Lotus.

Worli, Mumbai-18,
GSTIN No : 2TAAKCP4015D1Z0
Comp GST No : 27TAAACD1685R1Z3

Payment Term : Payment against PO Creation Date : 31/07/2024
material delivery & submission of PO Approval Date : 01/08/2024
Tax Invoice. PO Currency : INR

Buyer Name : Binu Balachandran

Regards,
Mrunal.

From: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Sent: 26 August 2024 09:43

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha <ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari
<amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Sachin Tirlotkar <statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit
<manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Approved.

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: Tuesday, August 20, 2024 5:52 PM

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha
<ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari <amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Sachin Tirlotkar
<statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit <manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>
Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

@Lovejot sir,

We need your approval to make necessary changes in the GST Number which was mentioned incorrectly for all the
DCPL Purchase Orders for the Bandra New & R City Mall locations.
Thanks.

Regards,
Mrunal.



From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 20 August 2024 12:12

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha
<ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari <amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Sachin Tirlotkar
<statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit <manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>
Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Mrunal ji and Vijay ji,

As discussed on call, please get the approval from Lovejot ji on mail to change GST number for CC Bandra
new branch.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: 19 August 2024 13:42

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha
<ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari <amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Sachin Tirlotkar
<statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit <manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>; Vijay
Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>

Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Hi team,
Any update on this?

Regards,
Mrunal.

From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 06 August 2024 17:19

To: Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha
<ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari <amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Sachin Tirlotkar
<statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit <manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>; Mrunal
Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Vijay ji,
As discussed on call please inform us when you are available to connect on teams call.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>

Sent: 05 August 2024 20:30

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha
<ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com>; Amit Tiwari <amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in>; Sachin Tirlotkar
<statutory.accounts@copperchimney.in>; Manthan Purohit <manthan.purohit@charcoalconcepts.com>; Mrunal
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Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Hi pls correct will be the same as Deluxe Corp address

Thanks & regards,
Vijay

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 11:23 AM

To: Vijay Sarkale <vijay.sarkale@charcoalconcepts.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ravi Jha
ravi.jha@charcoalconcepts.com; Amit Tiwari amit.tiwari@copperchimney.in

Subject: GST no. update request - CC Bandra New

Dear Sir,

The GST number for the ‘CC Bandra New’ branch is not reflecting the correct one (for all the POs made till date).
Need your intervention in this to resolve the same.

Reference mail is attached below.

Invoice Location Corporate Address

CC Bandra New Deluxe Caterers Pvt. Ltd.

266, Linking Road, Bandra, Mumbai Lotus Court Ground Floor Door No
400050 12A, Dr. Annie Besant Road, Lotus.

Worli, Mumbai-18,
GSTIN No : 27TAAKCP4015D1Z0
Comp GST No : 27TAAACD1685R1Z3

Payment Term : Payment against PO Creation Date : 31/07/2024
material delivery & submission of PO Approval Date : 01/08/2024
Tax Invoice. PO Currency : INR

Buyer Name : Binu Balachandran

Thanks & Regards,
Mr. Mrunal Joshi.
+91 83908 13805

From: Ahaan Mukherjee <ahaan.mukherjee@sonodyne.com>

Sent: 05 August 2024 11:06

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Cc: 'Subrata Chatterjee' <schatterjee@sonodyne.com>

Subject: FW: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :DCPL/PO/24-25/000129

Dear Sir,

Please confirm below required details:



1. As per GST, bill to & ship to site party name “PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO PRIVATE
LIMITED”
2. As per PO’s instructions, bill to & ship to site address same and GST no - 27AAKCP4015D120

Thanks,
Ahaan Mukherjee

From: procuresens@safalsoftcom.com [mailto:procuresens@safalsoftcom.com]

Sent: 02 August 2024 16:05

To: ahaan.mukherjee@sonodyne.com

Cc: lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in

Subject: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :DCPL/PO/24-25/000129

M/S SONODYNE TECHNOLOGIES PVT.LTD
Dear Sir / Madam,

Your Purchase Order is now Confirmed.Please Select Option..

PO Details as below
PO Number

PO Date
PO Value

Buyer Name

AccpetfRegret

Best Regards,

Procurement Department

K Hospitality Corp
1 Rashid Mansion, Worli Point, Mumbai - 400018, India

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

DCPL/PO/
25/00012¢

31/07/202
67069.20

Binu
Balachand

This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply back to this email ID. You are advised to login to K
Hospitality Corp for details. We recommend making your Password confidential as confidentiality is

completely supplier’s responsibility.



