Herambraj Sonawane

From: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 9, 2024 11:20 AM

To: delhit1 ITSupport

Subject: FW: Nukkad integration

Attachments: TRFP10229.pdf

Sanjay , raise PR
And confirm as per attached invoice .

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav
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From: Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, April 9, 2024 11:03 AM

To: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

Dear Rajesh,

Kindly create PO copy In safal and share APR for advance payment process.

Thanks,
Amit Upadhyay

From: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 08 April 2024 12:32

To: Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

Dear Amit ,
Please find revised invoice and do the needful and confirm .

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav
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From: Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 4, 2024 5:13 PM

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

Dear Rajesh Ji,

Please check the Pl bill to address, we are not process the advance payment of Delhi T3 .

Thanks,
Amit Upadhyay

From: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 26 March 2024 10:27

To: Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: Nukkad integration

++ Amit

For Advance Payment

From: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 26 March 2024 10:19

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Nukkad integration

Dear Team,

Need to pay for new app integration at Delhi T1d(TFSPL) , approval is attached here with by GM & VP IT,
so please release the payment .

Or let me know do I need to raise for PR in safal for the same as this is intangible .

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav
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From: Sunil Kumar <sunil.kumar@tridentinfo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 20, 2024 2:07 PM

To: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>; Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Rajesh,

Please find the attached Proforma Invoice as required.

Best Regards,

'
TRI z ENT | Sunil Kumar | Assistant Manager- Accounts & Finance
resiing Velues | T: +91 11 29216726 / 29219927 M: +91 9540109263
| E: sunil.kumar@tridentinfo.com

@ @ @ | www.tridentinfo.com

Trident Offices: New Delhi | Kolkata | Dubai
Client Locations: India | UAE | USA | KSA | Africa | Singapore

Trusted & Reliable ERP Implementation Partner Since 1999

Microsoft § [: e L7
Partner amond TS0 HCL SOFTWARE

The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this
message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future.

From: Rajesh Yadav rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com

Sent: Wednesday, March 20, 2024 1:28 PM

To: Rakesh Kumar Thakur rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com; Sunil Kumar <sunil.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

Dear Rakesh,
Please share Performa invoice .



With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav
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From: Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2024 3:02 PM

To: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Sunil Kumar <sunil.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Rajesh Ji,
Thanks for confirming the Order. Please ask for API details of infocode entry table if you require that.
@Sunil Kumar- Please raise a Pl to TFS for Nukkad APl integration for 20 Days @10000 per man-day.

Payment terms will be 50% advance and 50% after go-live

Thanks & Kind Regards,

S
TRI ENT | Rakesh Kumar | Group Project Manager

Cowaling Vet | T: +91 11 29216726 / 29219927 M: +91-9643108255
| E: rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com

® @ @ | www.tridentinfo.com

Trident Offices: New Delhi | Kolkata | Dubai
Client Locations: India | UAE | USA | KSA | Africa | Singapore

Trusted & Customer Focused Implementation Partner since 1999

MICTOSOft | oo cmrese seurca g ® L5 Central L
Partner | s YT — -
w ikt A cai PR Certified Parmer 2022 Business Partner | HCL S‘OFTWARE

The contents of this email are confidential and are for the intended recipient(s) named above only. If you are not the intended recipient, any copying, distribution or
use of this email is prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete the email.



From: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2024 3:34 PM

To: Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

Importance: High

Dear Rakesh ,

Ok agreed , please share me Performa invoice and let me know what other input do you need by Nukkad
side to start the work asap.

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav

COLEBRATING
Creating memaories and inspiring

happiness through food, since 1972

From: Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2024 11:30 AM

To: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Rajesh,

As discussed, Integration for shared API can be done in 15 days. But my quote was based on additional activity like
pulling the data of Info code entry and to make sure that data pulled at your HO also get posted through statement
posting. We may need to make some changes in the API so that statement could be posted and financial could be
updated.

Please try to make it for 20 days so that quality work could be done.

Thanks & Kind Regards,

S
T RI ENT | Rakesh Kumar | Group Project Manager

Cowaling Vet | T: +91 11 29216726 / 29219927 M: +91-9643108255
| E: rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com

® ® @ | www.tridentinfo.com




Trident Offices: New Delhi | Kolkata | Dubai
Client Locations: India | UAE | USA | KSA | Africa | Singapore

Trusted & Customer Focused Implementation Partner since 1999

IVTICTOSEN i i smmemse s Mo © 15 Central L
Partner | ctcaimame piamond B
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The contents of this email are confidential and are for the intended recipient(s) named above only. If you are not the intended recipient, any copying, distribution or
use of this email is prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete the email.

From: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, March 11, 2024 9:25 PM

To: Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Subject: Re: Nukkad integration

Gentle reminder

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav

Get Outlook for Android

From: Rajesh Yadav

Sent: Friday, March 8, 2024 5:30:26 PM

To: Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

Dear Rakesh,
As discussed we have got quote by more three partner and all have given below 15 days .

This time I have taken prior approval by VP IT to go with Trident and believe me if this task goes
successfully then gradually we will involve Trident completely with us .

So please send me revised quote to raise PO.

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav
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From: Rajesh Yadav

Sent: Friday, March 8, 2024 3:23 PM

To: Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

Dear Rakesh,
Please call me to discuss on days.

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav

CTILERRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
hoppiness through food, since 1972
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From: Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Sent: Friday, March 8, 2024 3:16 PM

To: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Subject: RE: Nukkad integration

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Rajesh Ji,
| have gone through the document. The integration will take around 25 man-days and total cost would be around 2.5

lacks + GST.
For Integration, we need one table, one code unit and one page in your Navision Database

Thanks & Kind Regards,

S,
T Rl ENT | Rakesh Kumar | Group Project Manager

e | T: +91 11 29216726 / 29219927 M: +91-9643108255
| E: rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com

@ @ @ | www.tridentinfo.com

Trident Offices: New Delhi | Kolkata | Dubai
Client Locations: India | UAE | USA | KSA | Africa | Singapore




Trusted & Customer Focused Implementation Partner since 1999
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The contents of this email are confidential and are for the intended recipient(s) named above only. If you are not the intended recipient, any copying, distribution or
use of this email is prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete the email.

From: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, March 4, 2024 10:37 AM

To: Rajneesh Bhagat <rajneesh@tridentinfo.com>

Cc: Rakesh Kumar Thakur <rakesh.kumar@tridentinfo.com>
Subject: FW: Nukkad integration

Dear Rajneesh ji,

Last week we have deployed “"Nukkad” at one outlet at terminal-1 , and want to get done integration to
get sales into our server , could you give me quote to do the same .

Please find Attached API .

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav
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