Herambraj Sonawane

From: Rajesh Yadav <rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, February 12, 2024 7:22 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane; Herambraj Sonawane; delhit1 ITSupport; Suresh Chand
Cc: Lovejot Sekhon

Subject: RE: Requriement for T1 DELHI

Hi

1,2 and 4 approved

With Regards,
Rajesh Yadav

Creating memaories and inspiring

happiness :?':'u:u,-:s'l' food, since 19

From: Nitin Singhal <nitins@Ilaksh.info>

Sent: Monday, February 12, 2024 5:51 PM

To: 'Herambraj Sonawane' <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>; Herambraj Sonawane
<mumbai.purchasel_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; delhitl ITSupport
<delhitl.itsupport@travelfoodservices.com>; Suresh Chand <suresh.chand@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Yadav
<rajesh.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Requriement for T1 DELHI

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Suresh,

As discussed please find below proposal for 2 KVA also.

:(I)' Description/ltem QTY Price Amount
1 | TP Link Archer C6 2 2250 4500
2 | TP Link Mr100 1 3225 3225
3 | APC 1 KVA UPS BX1100 1 5700 5700

OR
4 A_PC_2 K\_/A UPS BVX2200LI-IN 1 15500 15500

with inbuilt Battery

GST Extra

Price valid till stock lasts

Payment 100% Advance

Please check the model No before placing order material is non returnable

1



Thanks & Regards

. Nitin Singhal

' LAKSH IT Solutions & Security Systems Pvt Ltd
An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Co.

Ph. 011-35609550

LAKSH (g -09312252563,09717627999

From: Nitin Singhal [mailto:nitins@Iaksh.info]

Sent: 12 February 2024 16:24

To: 'Herambraj Sonawane' <mumbai.purchasel @k-corp.in>; ‘Herambraj Sonawane'
<mumbai.purchasel kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; 'delhitl ITSupport
<delhitl.itsupport@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: 'Lovejot Sekhon' <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Requriement for T1 DELHI

Dear Herambraj,

As per discussion with IT team please find below proposal.

Sl.

No Description/ltem QTY Price Amount
1 | TP Link Archer C6 2 2250 4500
2 [ TP Link Mr100 1 3225 3225
3 [ APC 1 KVA UPS BX1100 1 5700 5700

GST Extra

Price valid till stock lasts

Payment 100% Advance

Please check the model No before placing order material is non returnable

Thanks & Regards

¢ Nitin Singhal

' LAKSH IT Solutions & Security Systems Pvt Ltd
An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Co.

Ph. 011-35609550

LAKSH () .-09312252563,09717627999

From: Herambraj Sonawane [mailto:mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in]

Sent: 12 February 2024 15:03

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>
Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: Requriement for T1 DELHI

Dear Partner



Kindly provide Rate for below

Router Name - TP Link.
Router Model No - Archer C6U ( AC1200 MU-MIMI wifi router) — Qty -3
1 KV USP APC For Server —Qty 1

Delivery Location —DELHI T1 airport

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737



