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Herambraj Sonawane

From: SK TRADERS <sktraders442@yahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, July 5, 2024 4:42 PM
To: Herambraj Sonawane; Herambraj Sonawane
Cc: Lovejot Sekhon
Subject: Re: Hardware spares
Attachments: TFS 05-07.doc

Dear Sir  
 
 
                                            QUOTATION  
 
 

Item Description RATE 

Door Closer Dyna 
not 

clear 
14 inches telescopic rail 310/- 
19.05 mm star black screw 1 box 280/- 
1 inch star black screw 1 box 310/- 
1 inch star black screw 1 box 310/- 

WC seat hinges make toto 
not 

clear 
spray paint white 140/- 
spray paint black black 140/- 
spray paint silver 140/- 
Angular Stop cock Jaquar FUS-CHR-29053 1205/- 
Angular Stop Cock Jaquar ARI-CHR-39053 980/- 
Connection Hose 1.5 meter 450/- 
Thinner 1 liter can 140/- 
White cement 1 kg pack 28/- 
Turpentine 1 liter can 110/- 
POP 1 kg pack 30/- 
Silicon Sealant White 170/- 
WC Flush Plate Jaquar JCP-CHR-852415 1260/- 
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Gemini Filter Coffee Machine Tap Black 
not 

clear 
Pillar cock auto closing system Jaquar PRS-CHR-031 1950/- 

  
  
 
GST EXTRA 18%  
 
 
 
Thanks & Regards 

S. K.  Traders 
Mo. 9250629173  
 
On Saturday, June 29, 2024 at 05:15:38 PM GMT+5:30, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in> wrote:  
 
 

Dear partner 

  

Kindly find below detail and provide quote please 

  

Item Description Qty 
Door Closer Dyna  15 
14 inches telescopic rail 5 
19.05 mm star black screw 1 box 1 
1 inch star black screw 1 box 1 
1 inch star black screw 1 box  5 
WC seat hinges make toto  20 
spray paint white  20 
spray paint black black  20 
spray paint silver 20 
Angular Stop cock Jaquar FUS-CHR-29053 10 
Angular Stop Cock Jaquar ARI-CHR-39053 10 
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Connection Hose 1.5 meter  50 
Thinner 1 liter can  20 
White cement 1 kg pack  30 
Turpentine 1 liter can 20 
POP 1 kg pack  30 
Silicon Sealant White 40 
WC Flush Plate Jaquar JCP-CHR-852415 5 
Gemini Filter Coffee Machine Tap Black 30 
Pillar cock auto closing system Jaquar PRS-
CHR-031  1 

  

  

Delivery location – Chennai airport 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 

Heramb 

  

9702415737 

  

  


