Capex Purchase

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in>
Sent: 13 March 2024 12:25

To: Capex Purchase

Subject: Fwd: Food Court Area Kitchen Fresh Air Blower
Attachments: KITCHEN BLOWER (5).pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Get Outlook for i0S

From: nasim shaikh <gkengineers74@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 11, 2024 12:38:08 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>; sarvesh.yelekar@travelfoodservices.com <sarvesh.yelekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fwd: Food Court Area Kitchen Fresh Air Blower

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: nasim shaikh <gkengineers74(@gmail.com>

Date: Wed, 6 Mar 2024 at 14:04

Subject: Re: Food Court Area Kitchen Fresh Air Blower
To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Dear Sir,
I am sending for Quotation by attachment
G K ENGINEERS

NASIM



9822586679

On Mon, 4 Mar 2024 at 22:12, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase l @k-corp.in> wrote:

Reminder

Please provide revised rate .

Thanks & Regards

Heramb

9702415737

From: Herambraj Sonawane

Sent: Saturday, March 2, 2024 7:45 PM

To: gkengineers74(@gmail.com

Cc: Sarvesh Yelekar <sarvesh.yelekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>
Subject: Food Court Area Kitchen Fresh Air Blower




Dear Partner

As we discussed , kindly find below detail and revised Quote please

Food Court Area Kitchen Fresh Air Blower -GOA Airport

Sub; Quotation For Food Court Area Kitchen Fresh Air Blower

S.no. Description | HSN/SAC | Unit = Qty Rate Amount

Providing and installation of kitchen fresh air |

1 | blower cenirifugal blower dire drive 8000 CFM | 998873 | Mos 01 85000 85000
40 mm wg
Blower ducting connection 22 gauge Gl duct

2 Wit Tieodile connection 998873  Nos 01 35000 35000
Old damage blower remaoving work and new

. blower shifting work from basement to terrace 998873 | Nos 01 11500 11500

! | TOTAL 131500

Thanks & Regards

Heramb



9702415737



