Herambraj Sonawane

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Approved
Thanks and Regards

Ameet Koomar

Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>
Saturday, February 17, 2024 2:18 PM

Herambraj Sonawane

Akshay Sharma; Ravindra kumar singh; Farhin Shaikh; Jigna Sosa; Chhabir Sahoo;

Sanjeev Mishra; Megha Agarwal; Lovejot Sekhon;
harshad.vidhate@semolinakitchens.com
Re: LAB testing - Lucknow airport

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel @k-corp.in>
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2024 1:42:09 PM

To: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Ravindra kumar singh

<ravindra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Jigna Sosa

<jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>; Sanjeev Mishra
<sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Megha Agarwal <megha.agarwal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon

<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; harshad.vidhate@semolinakitchens.com <harshad.vidhate @semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: RE: LAB testing - Lucknow airport

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Dear sir

As we discussed , Kindly fine below summary for LAB testing at airport Lucknow

Request for your approval to process the same,

Type of Sample Frequency Apprx. Outlet Count Szrf:;)ligg Cost/Sample
Prepared Food Twice in a year 27 54 1976
Swab Hand Twice in a year 27 54 997.5
Swab Equipment Twice in a year 27 54t 997.5
Ice Twice in a year 27 54 2137.5
Water Twice in a year 27 54 997.5
Water with Radioactive Twice in a year 2 4 9975
Used oil On the basis of requirement B B B
Powdered Spices On the basis of requirement B B B
Flour Item On the basis of requirement _ _ _
Rice, Dals, Pulses and On the basis of requirement
Cereals - - -
Oils On the basis of requirement _ _ _
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Chicken/ Mutton On the basis of requirement B B
Packaging Material On the basis of requirement B B
Maida On the basis of requirement B B

Uniform Swab On the basis of requirement

Air Monitoring On the basis of requirement

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: Herambraj Sonawane

Sent: Wednesday, February 14, 2024 10:19 AM

To: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Ravindra kumar singh
<ravindra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Jigna Sosa
<jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>; Sanjeev Mishra
<sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Megha Agarwal <megha.agarwal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; harshad.vidhate@semolinakitchens.com

Subject: LAB testing - Lucknow airport

Dear Sir,

For the location Lucknow Airport we are finalized the vendor to work for Food/Water/Swab Testing Lab
process

As per the Base on below comparative and attached Quote , we finalized the vendor along with Additional 5%
Discount for the same work , till year 2027 ( There is no changes in rate for next Three year)

Kindly find below Vendor rate comparative and above attachment along with proposal , we are Going with
Vendor FARE Labs Private Limited for the Food/Water/Swab Testing Lab

On Our Lucknow SKPL entity , already same vendor working with us for the TFSR&R-HIGHWAYS ,and also
in DELHI-TFS .

Request for your approval to go ahead with the FARE Labs Private Limited .

. FARE Labs FARE La
SKPL-LUCKNOW HYDRO LAB Equinox Labs Private Limited | Limited
;Pé Description QTY Rate Rate Rate Rate
1 Food/Water/Swab Testing Lab 1 101600 125100 83880 79686
GST 18% 18288 22518 15098.4 14343.4
Final Amount 119888 147618 98978.4 94029.4
Note- There is no changes in rate for next Three year till 2027




Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for
the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you
are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in
part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any
attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily
represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the
presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.



