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Capex Purchase

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>
Sent: 30 July 2024 09:16
To: Capex Purchase
Subject: FW: REQUEST FOR PURCHASE ORDER

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 
the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Create a direct PO on Astar for temporary Signage - 18k.+ GST 
 
From: A Star Innovation <account@astarinnovation.com>  
Sent: 29 July 2024 18:45 
To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Bazmi Siddiqui <b.siddiqui@astarinnovation.com> 
Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR PURCHASE ORDER 
 
Dear Sir, 
                We request you to kindly manage to release the "PURCHASE ORDER" as 
per trail mail, because we were generated the bill against the below trail mail but the 
bill is not processed without P.O yet for payment , So we request you to look into the 
matter and sort it out. 
 
We are still waiting for your favorable reply. 
 
Looking forward to the best relationship with your esteemed organisation. 
 
 
Thanks & Regards 
 
Team Accounts 
A-Star Innovation 
E-Mail : account@astarinnovation.com 
Mob : +91-7080900390 
 
 
On Wed, 3 Apr 2024 at 14:44, A Star Innovation <account@astarinnovation.com> 
wrote: 

Dear Sir, 
               Please find the below trail mail with work images & we request you to 
kindly manage to release the "PURCHASE ORDER". 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Sanjiv Dhawan <Sanjiv.Dhawan@adani.com> 
Date: Tue, 6 Feb 2024 at 07:48 
Subject: RE: Irish hoise signage - Lucknow 
To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-
corp.in>, b.siddiqui@astarinnovation.com <b.siddiqui@astarinnovation.com>, info@
astarinnovation.com <info@astarinnovation.com> 
Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Akshay Sharma 
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<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>, Binu Balachandran 
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
 

Pls ensure the signage is installed today EOD without fail. 

  

Thanks, 

Sanjiv 

  

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in> 
Sent: Monday, February 5, 2024 8:30 PM 
To: b.siddiqui@astarinnovation.com; info@astarinnovation.com 
Cc: Sanjiv Dhawan <Sanjiv.Dhawan@adani.com>; Lovejot Sekhon 
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Akshay Sharma 
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Binu Balachandran 
<binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Irish hoise signage - Lucknow 

  

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and 
attachments.* 

  

Hi Mohammad,  

  

As discussed and agreed over the call, we can have the commercials closed at 18k. 

Request you to please proceed with the production as per specifications agreed with 
Mr. Sanjiv and team. 

  

Also share a PI for the same to process an order 

  

  

Regards 

Stephen 

 
Looking forward to the best relationship with your esteemed organisation. 
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Thanks & Regards 
 
Team Accounts 
A-Star Innovation 
E-Mail : account@astarinnovation.com 
Mob : +91-7080900390 


