Mrunal Joshi

From: Binu Balachandran

Sent: 25 June 2024 15:18

To: Mrunal Joshi

Subject: FW: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Attachments: LT_PANEL_OFFER.pdf; domino's extra item (1).xIsx; BBN 2023-24-04-038

01-06-2024.pdf

LT Panel
Regards

Binu Balachandran
+91-8452876061

From: Binu Balachandran

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 6:21 PM

To: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Cc: sminfra.piyush@gmail.com; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project
<Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ajit Singh
<ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama
Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear Prashant,

Final approval amount 3.02 Lacs ( before taxes)

S.NO (ITEM UNIT aty RATE AMOUNT
T|PANNEL
PANNEL COSTING NOS 1.00 24000000 % 2,40,000.00
LOADING/UNLOADING NOS 1.00 10000000 % 10,000.00
CARTAGE NOS 1.00 F5,000000 % 5,000.00
A MATERIAL TOTAL L 2,55,000.00
LABOUR NOS 1.00 $20,000.00] % 20,000.00
B LABOUR TOTAL L 20,000.00
C TOTAL A+B L 2,75,000.00
E TOTAL C+D L 2,75,000.00
F PROFIT @ 13% L 27,500.00
TOTAL E+F L 3,02,500.00
Regards

Binu Balachandran
+91-8452876061



From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 5:05 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: sminfra.piyush@gmail.com; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project
<Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ajit Singh
<ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama
Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear sir,
pfa of alternative quotation.

Regards
Prashant Singhal
Phone: +91 7417405315

On Mon, Jun 10, 2024 at 12:35 PM Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Piyush,

Kindly proceed as discussed with alternative quotation from reputed panel manufacturer only

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 6, 2024 4:51 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi
Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh
Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Sir ok we bill do it for next time but it not for now.



Regards,

Prashant singhal

On Thu, 6 Jun 2024, 4:43 pm Binu Balachandran, <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Prashant,

Need to take minimum 3 quotations from different suppliers

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 6, 2024 11:28 AM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi
Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh
Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear sir.

PFA of panel approval for domino's.

Regards

Prashant Singhal



Phone: +91 7417405315

On Mon, Jun 3, 2024 at 2:06 PM Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Prashant

Rates submitted are higher , please do not proceed unless communicated .

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>

Sent: Monday, June 3, 2024 12:30 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Cc: sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>;
Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Prashant
Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi
<manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Hi Binu,

PFA our quotes for Nugreen. Plese create po according to the rates mentioned in attached Pi.

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman
| @ +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



From: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Sent: 03 June 2024 12:04

To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>

Cc: sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>;
Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Prashant
Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi
<manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Sandeep/Abdul,

Please check & approve if rates are in line with our purchase .

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, June 1, 2024 10:52 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>;
Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet
Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama
Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear sir,

PFA of taco Bell grease chamber quotation.

Please approved the same so we start our procurement process.

Regards,

Prashant Singhal



On Sat, 1 Jun 2024, 1:46 pm Prashant Singhal, <prashant.singhal1992@gmail.com> wrote:

Material is already at site and start work also.

On Sat, 1 Jun 2024, 10:52 am Binu Balachandran, <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

SM infra,

Kindly note following outlet MS Fabrication have been awarded/ under approval, please plan material
accordingly

e Delhi Subway
e KFC
e Domino’s

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, May 24, 2024 1:30 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi
Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet
Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama
Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear sir,

Thankyou for the same.



I hope we can consider the same for dominos also for similar works like Copper pipe, Chamber and Gi
conduct.

Thanks & Regards

On Fri, May 24, 2024 at 1:25 PM Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Piyush ji,

Below commercial has been approved with attached supporting documents.

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 23, 2024 6:56 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi
Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet
Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>;
Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear Binu ji ,



As discussed PFA Purchase bill for chambers for 1sr no. item and for others pls refer to the excel
sheet with detailed RA of each item.

Thx

On Thu, May 23, 2024 at 3:22 PM Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Piyush,

Post joint call find remarks and approvals as per submitted document, Kindly go ahead with items approved in
extra items below.

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Binu Balachandran

Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2024 4:30 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; prashant.singhal1992@gmail.com

Cc: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project
<Delhi.Project@Travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh
Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama
Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Shadab/Prashant,

Find attached remarks as discussed jointly with both Shadab & Prashant , please share documents for way
forward



Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, May 20, 2024 3:21 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project
<Delhi.Project@Travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh
Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama
Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear Binu,

Please find updated comments, also guide us to upload PR for additional Items

Regards

Shadab Sukri

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 15 May 2024 05:30 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project
<delhi.project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh
Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>;
Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Less vendor

Dear Binu,



Please find attached comments

Regards

Shadab Sukri

From: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Sent: 15 May 2024 05:13 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <Sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>;
Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>; Delhi Project
<Delhi.Project@Travelfoodservices.com>; risminfra@gmail.com; sminfrasushant@gmail.com; Ajit Singh
<ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>;
Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Shadab/ Ajit,

SM infra is submitting additional bills , kindly certify the scope and quantity before taking up form
commercial approvals.

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, May 13, 2024 4:55 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <Sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>;
Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project
<Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; risminfra@gmail.com; sminfrasushant@gmail.com; Ajit Singh
<ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: FW: taco bell extra item approval
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Dear sir,

PFA of quotation.

Regards
Prashant Singhal

Phone: +91 7417405315

On Wed, May 8, 2024 at 10:31 AM Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

We have already started all the work at Taco bell.

We need approval on this on an urgent basis to speed up work in domino's so please close it today.

Regards
Prashant Singhal

Phone: +91 7417405315

11



On Tue, May 7, 2024 at 7:47 PM Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Prashant

The attached work needs to be done so kindly proceed with the work .

Binu: This work needs to be happen and some work already initiated so please finalise the commercials
with SM infra team

Regards

Ajit Singh

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 7, 2024 7:03 PM

To: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar
<prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <Sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Shadab Sukri
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@Travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra.
sushant <sminfrasushant@gmail.com>; raju <rjsminfra@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: FW: taco bell extra item approval

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mr. Binu,

As discussed PFA NT items list with proper RA and supporting documents, kindly review and
approve ,

Pls feel free to call incase of any issue or clarification required.

Aside Ajit Singh ji pls acknowledge the work done or has to happen for the list of extra items , for
rates we will discuss with the commercial but before that you have to confirm that the same was
required and is either executed on site or has to be done in near future.

12



PI note the extra items are touching approx. 9 lacs for a PO of approx. 29 lacs which is more than
30% , we only deviate 5% plus minus. but keeping in preview our new relationship we have done
almost all of the extra work in taco bell but in Dominos we can only do the extra work once we get
At least Taco bell PO of extra items .

So request you to kindly take this on top most priority , looking forward for your kind support.

Regards
Prashant Singhal

Phone: +91 7417405315

On Mon, Apr 29, 2024 at 12:45 PM Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Prashant,

Please proceed your orders are under approval from management

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2024 8:12 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar
<prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <Sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Shadab Sukri
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: FW: taco bell extra item approval

13



Dear sir,

Sorry for ms rate it's 175ts per kg not 185kg.

Please confirm so I will start working on it.

Regards,

Prashant singhal

On Fri, 26 Apr 2024, 3:40 pm Prashant Singhal, <prashant.singhal1992@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

PFA of revised quotation as discussed.

Also we start ms work please share its po 185per kg same quote in biding.

Regards
Prashant Singhal

Phone: +91 7417405315

On Thu, Apr 25, 2024 at 3:11 PM Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Prashant ji,

Panel rates are okay, rest details to be resubmitted as discussed.

14



Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 25, 2024 9:56 AM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar
<prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <Sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Shadab Sukri
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear sir,

PFA is revised as per detail.

Regards
Prashant Singhal

Phone: +91 7417405315

On Wed, Apr 24, 2024 at 12:57 PM Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Prashant /Ajit/Prabhat,
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Following are the observation in attached additional work details without which commercial cannot be
finalised , kindly have the below details

1. Chamber size and complete finishing details not mentioned in attached additional work, specs
to be verified by site team
2. Panel SLD and itemised BOQ

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 22,2024 1:39 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: sminfra piyush <Sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Shadab Sukri
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>;
Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: FW: taco bell extra item approval

Dear sir,

PFA of extra item for taco bell.

Regards,

Prashant singhal

On Mon, 22 Apr 2024, 1:15 pm Ajit Singh, <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Prashant

Pls share the same the commercials to Binu, but this needs to be done urgently its pending from
quite a long.
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Regards

Ajit Singh

From: sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 22,2024 12:12 PM

To: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar
<prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfrasushant@gmail.com
Subject: Re: taco bell extra item approval

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi prashant,

pls provide this properly

Thx

On Fri, Apr 19, 2024 at 3:55 PM Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992@gmail.com>
wrote:

Dear sir,

Please approve three nos extra items at taco bell site.
1)Electrical Pannel-1.62 lac
2)Chamber-1.08lac

3)Copper pipe-1.04lac.
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All rates are including 15%

Regards
Prashant Singhal

Phone: +91 7417405315

Regards,

Piyush makkar
SM INFRA

M: 09999923691

Regards,

Piyush makkar
SM INFRA

M: 09999923691
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Regards,

Piyush makkar
SM INFRA

M: 09999923691
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