
1

Mrunal Joshi

From: Mahamaya Engineering <mahamaya.engineering1@gmail.com>
Sent: 14 November 2024 17:33
To: Mrunal Joshi
Cc: Stephen P; Pushpak Shewale; Sarvesh Patil
Subject: Re: Target Price- Add. HVAC- TVD Lounge

 
 
 
Dear Sir/Ma'am, 
 
My final regret price @ 107250. 
 
 
 
Should you require any further information / clarifications in this regard, kindly call me at +91-
9205300857 
Regards 
Yash Katoch 
 
 
MAHAMAYA ENGINEERING 
S-200,School block,shakarpur, 
Delhi 110092. 
Mob.9540071243, 9205300857. 
 
 
 
On Thu, 14 Nov 2024 at 1:31 PM, Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in> wrote: 
Hi Yash ji, 
 
Just a correction in cost centre, it is for Trivendram Lounge not for Barista. 
 
Thanks. 
 

From: Mrunal Joshi 
Sent: Wednesday, November 13, 2024 6:20:03 PM 
To: Mahamaya Engineering <mahamaya.engineering1@gmail.com> 
Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil 
<sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Target Price- Add. HVAC- TVD Lounge  
  

Hi Mr. Yash, 
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PFA the target prices against your quotation received for Barista Cart, Delhi T1. 

We appreciate your acceptance/counter offer on the same at the earliest convenience. 

Thank you. 

  

 

  

Regards, 

Mrunal. 

  

  


