Ramendra Singh

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com>

Sent: 05 July 2024 11:22

To: Ramendra Singh

Cc: Herambraj Sonawane; shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in
Subject: Re: Quotation for Welding Machine

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.
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Ok from our side

Best Wishes,

M. A. Electrical Solutions

6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai — 400007 .
Meghal Parikh

meghalparikh1969@gmail.com

+91-9930211622

Crystal Hospitality

info@crystal-hospitality.com

www.crystal-hospitality.com

Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai — 400026.
Adit Parikh

adtmprkh@gmail.com

+91-9930907674

GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP

Virus-free.www.avast.com

On Fri, 5 Jul 2024 at 11:21, Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Meghal ji,

As we discussed with you we are finalize the price

1) Welding Machine 250 - 300 Amp -- 1 no Rate : 8500/- per + Gst ( 1+ 2 Phase ) Brand JK

Kindly confirm the same



Thanks & Regards-
Ramendra

9999118677



