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Sarvesh Patil

From: sachin yadav <sachinby10@gmail.com>
Sent: 21 November 2024 18:35
To: Sarvesh Patil
Cc: tushar.b.arora@gmail.com; Stephen P; Mrunal Joshi; Pushpak Shewale; TLS
Subject: Re: PR for Lights for Delhi T3 Nandos

Phase Cut dimmable driver Rs. 1550/-+gst. 
 
Rgds, 
Sachin.9967222999 
 
On Thu, Nov 21, 2024 at 5:54 PM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi, 
  
Need price for Phase cut dimmable only for sr no 1 
  
  
Thanks & Regards, 
Sarvesh Patil 
  
From: sachin yadav <sachinby10@gmail.com>  
Sent: 13 November 2024 12:57 
To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Cc: tushar.b.arora@gmail.com; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-
corp.in>; TLS <ops.lightsquare@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: PR for Lights for Delhi T3 Nandos 
  
Hi Sarvesh Sir, 
  
Ref to trailing mail, pfa quotation with best offered price. 
  
For any queries kindly drop a call or reply to this mail. 
  

Regards, 

The Light Square 

Authorized Channel Partner of PHILIPS 

B-21, Durian Estate, Goregaon Mulund Link Road, 

Goregaon (E), Mumbai - 400063. 

SACHIN. 

M: 9967222999   

On Wed, Nov 13, 2024 at 10:56 AM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi, 
  
We have a requirement for Lights in Delhi. Attached to this email, you will find the supporting documents. (BOQ) 
  
Request you to look into it and quote for the same on priority. 
  
  
Thanks & Regards, 
Sarvesh Patil 

+91 98208 36480 


