Sarvesh Patil

From: shunnal ligade <shunnal.ligade@gmail.com>

Sent: 13 November 2024 18:45

To: Sarvesh Patil

Cc: Stephen P; Mrunal Joshi; Pushpak Shewale

Subject: Re: PR for Art work for 080 Domestic Lounge Phase I
Attachments: T1.pdf

Hi Sarvesh,

Please check the attachment. This is the quotation I had sent.

Thank you
Shunnal Ligade

On Mon, Nov 11, 2024 at 2:22 PM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:
Hi Shunnal,

Can you just forward the quotation which you had sent to Ahana.

Thanks & Regards,

Sarvesh Patil

From: shunnal ligade <shunnal.ligade@gmail.com>

Sent: 07 November 2024 07:59

To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale @k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: PR for Art work for 080 Domestic Lounge Phase Il

Hi Sarvesh,
I have already sent the quotation to Ahana.
Let me know if there is anything else needed from me.

Thank you
Shunnal Ligade

On Mon, 4 Nov 2024 at 6:06 PM, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi,

We have a requirement for Artwork in Bangalore. Attached to this email, you will find the supporting documents. (BOQ)
Request you to look into it and quote for the same on priority.

Thanks & Regards,

Sarvesh Patil
+91 98208 36480



