Sarvesh Patil

From: Faisal - Marcon - Marketing Project Manager <Projects@marconsignage.com>
Sent: 31 December 2024 12:22

To: Manisha Bakde

Cc: Sarvesh Patil; Marcon Signage

Subject: Re: IDLI .com Signage

Attachments: MARCON SIGNAGE- FINAL NO REGRET ESTIMATE - 31ST DEC 2024.pdf
Hello,

I hope you're doing well. Please find attached our final no-regret estimate, prepared with due
consideration of our longstanding relationship with Semolina Kitchens.

Regards,

Faisal S M: +91-8169195038
Marketing Project Manager | E: projects@marconsignage.com

Marcon Signage Pvt. Ltd
M ARGDN Marcon Display Solutions

Bespoke Signage Solutions Mumbai, India.

m www.marconsignage.com
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On Fri, 27 Dec 2024 at 14:12, Marcon Signage <marcondisplay@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello,

Please find attached our estimate with 2 options.
Feel free to contact us if you have any queries.
Thank you

On Thu, 26 Dec 2024, 10:50 Manisha Bakde, <manisha.bakde@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Please share the quote ASAP.

Regards,
Manisha.

From: Manisha Bakde <manisha.bakde@semolinakitchens.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2024 4:40 PM

Cc: Sarvesh Patil K-Corp <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Fw: IDLI .com Signage

Dear Sir,

Please share the rates as per the attached ART work. Also request you to share the samples.



https://we.tl/t-GMjZvNaByF

idli.com.zip

1 file sent via WeTransfer, the simplest way to send your files around the world

we.tl

Regards,
Manisha.



