Sarvesh Patil

From: Ashish Jain <artemislightingstudio@gmail.com>
Sent: 02 December 2024 20:22

To: Sarvesh Patil

Cc: Stephen P

Subject: Re: Quotation

packing cost approx 20000

Thanks & Regards

Artemis Lighting Studio

2-N LAXMI INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
LINK ROAD ANDHERI (w)
MUMBALI - 400053

ASHISH JAIN 9757395832

I

https://artemislightingstudio.com/

“Ihttps://instagram.com/artemislighting?igshid=1nt2318j4h5nq

On Mon, Dec 2, 2024 at 11:32 AM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:
Hi,

As discussed please share the packaging cost (Corrugated & Wooden box).

Thanks & Regards,
Sarvesh Patil

From: Ashish Jain <artemislightingstudio@gmail.com>

Sent: 15 November 2024 17:14

To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: Quotation

Dear Sir,

Please find attached quotation with discounted price.

Thanks & Regards

Artemis Lighting Studio

2-N LAXMI INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
LINK ROAD ANDHERI (w)
MUMBALI - 400053



ASHISH JAIN 9757395832

https://artemislightingstudio.com/

https://instagram.com/artemislighting?igshid=1nt238j4h5ng

On Fri, Nov 15, 2024 at 4:53 PM Ashish Jain <artemislightingstudio@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please find attached quotation

Thanks & Regards

Artemis Lighting Studio

2-N LAXMI INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
LINK ROAD ANDHERI (w)
MUMBALI - 400053

ASHISH JAIN 9757395832

https://artemislightingstudio.com/

https://instagram.com/artemislighting?igshid=1nt238j4h5ng




