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Sarvesh Patil

From: Ashish Jain <artemislightingstudio@gmail.com>
Sent: 20 December 2024 13:13
To: Sarvesh Patil
Subject: Re: Quotation
Attachments: QUOTATION - 20.12.24.xlsx

Dear Sir, 
 
Please find attached quotation- 
 
 
Thanks & Regards 
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On Fri, Dec 20, 2024 at 12:11 PM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi, 

  

As previously mentioned, the light below has been selected as a replacement for the Jacob light. Kindly provide the 
quotation for the same. 
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Thanks & Regards, 

Sarvesh Patil 

  

From: Ashish Jain <artemislightingstudio@gmail.com>  
Sent: 02 December 2024 20:22 
To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: Quotation 

  

packing cost approx 20000 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 
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On Mon, Dec 2, 2024 at 11:32 AM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi, 



3

  

As discussed please share the packaging cost (Corrugated & Wooden box). 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Sarvesh Patil 

  

From: Ashish Jain <artemislightingstudio@gmail.com>  
Sent: 15 November 2024 17:14 
To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: Quotation 

  

Dear Sir, 

  

Please find attached quotation with discounted price. 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 
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4

 https://instagram.com/artemislighting?igshid=1nt23f8j4h5nq 

  

  

On Fri, Nov 15, 2024 at 4:53 PM Ashish Jain <artemislightingstudio@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir, 

  

Please find attached quotation 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 
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