Sarvesh Patil

From: ANHA LIGHTS <helpdesk.anhalights@gmail.com>
Sent: 02 December 2024 11:45

To: Sarvesh Patil

Subject: Re: FW: PR for Lights for Delhi T3 Nandos

Hii Savesh Sir,

Hope your doing well !!

As per the telephonic discussion with devendra pawar sir the size will be standard as mentioned in the above quotation sheet.
My Transportation is will be extra at actual and packaging is included with the material given price.

Payment terms will be as follows.

50 % advance with your purchase order and 50% before delhivery against proforma invoice.

Awaiting for your purchase order confirmation.

On Mon, Dec 2, 2024 at 11:28 AM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi,
Please confirm if the cost includes packaging & transportation up to Delhi airport.

Thanks & Regards,
Sarvesh Patil

From: ANHA LIGHTS <helpdesk.anhalights@gmail.com>
Sent: 28 November 2024 15:17

To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: PR for Lights for Delhi T3 Nandos

On Thu, Nov 28, 2024 at 3:09 PM ANHA LIGHTS <helpdesk.anhalights@gmail.com> wrote:

On Wed, Nov 27, 2024 at 6:07 PM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi

’

As discussed please find enclosed TARGET PRICE kindly confirm your final no regret price to proceed further

Thanks & Regards,
Sarvesh Patil

From: ANHA LIGHTS <helpdesk.anhalights@gmail.com>
Sent: 22 November 2024 11:55

To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: PR for Lights for Delhi T3 Nandos

Any Update 77?7
On Tue, Nov 19, 2024 at 12:20 PM ANHA LIGHTS <helpdesk.anhalights@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,
Please Find the attached Quotation Sheet.

On Tue, Nov 19, 2024 at 12:16 PM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:

From: Sarvesh Patil
Sent: 13 November 2024 10:36

To: helpdesk@anhalights.com



Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@Xk-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>
Subject: PR for Lights for Delhi T3 Nandos

Hi,
We have a requirement for Lights in Delhi. Attached to this email, you will find the supporting documents. (BOQ)
Request you to look into it and quote for the same on priority.
Thanks & Regards,
Sarvesh Patil

+91 98208 36480

Thanks & Regards,
Abhishek Bade
Accounts Manager
7707074949

Anha Lights
Mankar Chowk,
Wakad, Pune,
411057



