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Sarvesh Patil

From: Saffronish Art Studio <saffronishartstudio@gmail.com>
Sent: 25 October 2024 12:53
To: Sarvesh Patil; Stephen P
Subject: Fwd: Artwork for BIAL T1
Attachments: Estimate_84_2024-10-20.pdf

Hi sarvesh,  
Kindly check this  
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Saffronish Art Studio <saffronishartstudio@gmail.com> 
Date: Fri, Sep 20, 2024 at 12:18 PM 
Subject: Re: Artwork for BIAL T1 
To: Aahana Miller <aahana@abmarchitects.com> 
Cc: Ashok Solanki <ashok@abmarchitects.com> 
 

Greeting All, 
 
  Kindly check the estimate below for the art work.  
The Timeline of the complete art work would be 16 working days from the time of approval and passes approval for entry. 
 
Thank you  
Mahesh S Hulliyur  
Art Director  
 
On Thu, Sep 19, 2024 at 3:41 PM Aahana Miller <aahana@abmarchitects.com> wrote: 

Dear Mahesh, 
 
As discussed please find artwork concept with sizes. Do share your quote and timeline for the same as soon as possible. 
 
Thank you 
 
 

Regards, 

Aahana Miller 

Principal Architect 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

Studio Millernium 

665, Veer Savarkar Marg 

Dadar West 

Mumbai 400028 

 
 
 
--  
Thanks & Regards  
Artist - Mahesh S Hulliyur 
Ph: +91-8095-104649, +91-9901-815502 
www.saffronish.com 



2

 
 
 
 
--  
Thanks & Regards  
Artist - Mahesh S Hulliyur 
Ph: +91-8095-104649, +91-9901-815502 
www.saffronish.com 

 


