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Ramendra Singh

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com>
Sent: 06 November 2024 17:27
To: Ramendra Singh
Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma; Herambraj Sonawane
Subject: Re: Qtn required for 24 Inch Wall Mouted fan& Exhoust fan

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 

 
 

Sir 
 
Please find below the revised Quote 
 
Item Qty RATE 
Almonard 12 inch Heavy Duty Single Phase 
EXHAUST FAN 2 2750/- per + Gst 
almonard 24 Inch 600MM Air Circulator 600 
mm 3 Blade Wall Fan  (Ultra High Speed | 
Green ) 2 9100/- per + Gst 

Delivery Included 
Payment 100% Advance against PO 
delivery : 2-3 Days from receipt of Payment 
 
 
 
Best Wishes, 
M. A. Electrical Solutions 
6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai – 400007. 
Meghal Parikh 
meghalparikh1969@gmail.com 
+91-9930211622 
Crystal Hospitality 
info@crystal-hospitality.com 
www.crystal-hospitality.com 
Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai – 400026. 
Adit Parikh 
adtmprkh@gmail.com 
+91-9930907674 
GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP 
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On Tue, 5 Nov 2024 at 17:07, Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969@gmail.com> wrote: 

Sir 
 
Please check below the rate against your inquiry 
Item Qty RATE 
Almonard 12 inch Heavy Duty Single Phase 
EXHOUST FAN 2 3360/- per + Gst 
almonard 24 Inch 600MM Air Circulator 600 
mm 3 Blade Wall Fan  (Ultra High Speed | 
Green ) 2 10577/- per + Gst 

Delivery Included 
Payment 100% Advance against PO 
delivery : 2-3 Days from receipt of Payment 
 
Best Wishes, 
M. A. Electrical Solutions 
6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai – 400007. 
Meghal Parikh 
meghalparikh1969@gmail.com 
+91-9930211622 
Crystal Hospitality 
info@crystal-hospitality.com 
www.crystal-hospitality.com 
Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai – 400026. 
Adit Parikh 
adtmprkh@gmail.com 
+91-9930907674 
GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP 
 
 
On Tue, 5 Nov 2024 at 13:29, Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote: 

Dear Partners, 

  

Kindly share the below Item Qtn for given location 

  

Item Qty Delivery location 
Almonard 12 inch Heavy Duty Single Phase 
EXHOUST FAN 2 Kurla Mumabai 
almonard 24 Inch 600MM Air Circulator 600 mm 3 
Blade Wall Fan  (Ultra High Speed | Green )  2 Kurla Mumabai 
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Wall Fan 

 

  

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Ramendra Singh 

9999118677 

  

  


